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Abstract 
Too many people throughout the world are unhealthy, stressed, and discon-
nected from the community because they spend too much time being angry 
or in fear, and too much time having self-centered thoughts and judging oth-
ers. People are not being their true selves. The Eplerian Philosophy based on 
brain science is defined as “know who you are moment by moment.” This 
means know the brain region at any given moment and learn to quickly leave 
the unhealthy brain regions. The less time people think about themselves, the 
more they become their true selves. 
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1. Introduction 

Too many people worldwide are unhealthy, stressed, and disconnected from the 
community because they spend too much time being angry or in fear, and too 
much time having thoughts of self-criticism, self-pity, jealously, retaliation and 
taking from others. People are not their true selves. They’re letting themselves be 
told who they are. They’re trying to be someone else. If people are their true 
selves, then their anger and fear vanish in a moment. Their self-centered think-
ing is transferred to more productive and creative thoughts in a moment. 

The concept of knowing who you are dates to ancient philosophers with the 
aphorism, “know thyself”, inscribed in granite 3400 years ago. Socrates wrote 
“the unexamined life is not worth living”, and Aristotle wrote “to know thyself is 
the beginning of wisdom” (LeDoux et al., 2018). This concept has survived 
thousands of years and has prompted several interpretations including knowing 
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unconscious conflicts and the conscious self in the here and now (LeDoux et al., 
2018), accurate self-appraisal (Krueger et al., 2011), and self-knowledge (Wilson 
2009). But, what are the benefits? 

Knowing who you are results in freedom. You don’t need to listen to anyone. 
You’re not controlled by anyone. You don’t compare yourself to anyone. There 
is no need for blame, criticism, judgment or excuses. Yet, there are too few 
people that arrive at this point in their lives. Most people are trying to be the un-
attainable perfect person in their minds. They continue to judge others. This is 
unhealthy, unproductive and results in self-centered citizens. What is needed is 
an easy, reproducible method for people to “know who they are.” 

2. The Eplerian Philosophy 

Brain science has shown many different independent brain regions (Hou et al., 
2020; Kral et al., 2019; Le et al., 2019; Wang et al., 2019; Leong et al., 2018; Zhang 
et al., 2018; Oei et al., 2018) and people can only think from one brain region at a 
time. Thinking from some regions like the decision-making prefrontal cortex 
and creative-thinking frontal cortex result in healthy and productive outcomes. 
Sustained thinking from the amygdala anger region (Wang et al., 2018) and the 
posterior cingulate cortex self-thinking region (Brewer & Garrison, 2014; Leech 
& Sharp, 2014) result in poor health, decreased productivity, lack of innovation, 
and disconnection from the community. 

The Eplerian philosophy is defined by seven words: “know who you are mo-
ment by moment.” Using the limited “know who you are” is too general and so 
variable that it has been rendered meaningless. However, adding the three words, 
“moment by moment,” adds accuracy and clarification to the concept. Everyone 
can know who they are at any given moment because everyone can know the 
brain region where the thoughts originate. Furthermore, people can learn to 
move out of the bad regions within a few seconds and into healthy brain regions. 
Anger and fear are everyday emotions, and if sustained for more than a few 
seconds, cause the stress-inflammatory response and ill health. People who learn 
to leave the cingulate region are healthier, more productive, more creative, enjoy 
life more, and are better citizens than counterparts who spend long periods of 
time thinking from the cingulate (Leech & Sharp, 2014). Paradoxically, the less 
time thinking about yourself, the more you are your true self, i.e., know who you 
are moment by moment.  

For people, the Eplerian philosophy is relevant for learning how to eliminate 
the harmful effects of emotional stress by managing anger, fear, anxiety, and 
sadness. The philosophy will help manage the stress caused by the many types of 
self-thinking including self-criticism, self-pity, resentment, jealously, revenge, 
judgment, and blame. Manage the stress by learning how to leave the amygdala 
anger center and the cingulate self-thinking center in a few seconds. Obtain the 
benefit of stress and eliminate the harm. There are several ways to stop thinking 
from these counterproductive regions. For example, feel the physical reaction to 
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anger and fear for a few seconds excluding all other thoughts, let the emotional 
feelings peak, and the anger and fear will pass. Another way to leave these brain 
regions is to do the opposite behavior. Anger means something has been taken, 
e.g., pride, integrity, self-worth or autonomy; therefore, leave the amygdala an-
ger center by doing the opposite, which is to give with expecting nothing in re-
turn. Give time, give energy, and give help. Cingulate thinking is also a “taking 
behavior” with blame, jealousy, resentment, and judgment; therefore, do the 
opposite by giving. For self-criticism and self-pity from cingulate thinking, 
self-compassion is the opposite. Be kind to yourself. Transferring out of these 
two brain regions in a few seconds will neutralize harmful health effects.  

For business, the Eplerian philosophy protocol can be used for increased 
productivity and innovation by learning to quickly leave the amygdala anger re-
gion and the cingulate self-thinking center. Thinking from these primitive brain 
regions for more than a few seconds decreases productivity, performance, and 
creativity. Daily stress from too much work, deadlines, blame, and lack of con-
trol trigger the amygdala and cingulate regions causing elevated blood pressure, 
increased the heart rate, muscle tenseness, and shuts down the defense system 
and digestion. Uncontrolled stress leads to inflammation, heart disease, stroke, 
cancer, and a shortened life. Stress needs to be neutralized quickly before caus-
ing harm. Anger, fear, anxiety, and sadness are part of everyday life. Learn to ex-
tract the benefit of these emotions and neutralize.  

The Eplerian philosophy model can be used for improved creativity and in-
novation at work. Learn to quickly stop thinking from the amygdala and cingu-
late regions and go to the creative brain region. For the best result, take the 
prefrontal cortex offline because thinking from this region is too judgmental 
and rigid for the free-thinking process needed for innovation. Remember the 
need to keep the creative brain region healthy for optimal innovation. The crea-
tive region and other positive brain regions are sensitive to unhealthy habits; 
and require eight hours of sleep, daily exercise, alpha-brainwave meditation 
time, and healthy nutrition. Learn the Eplerian philosophy for breakthrough 
innovation.  

Additional applications of the Eplerian philosophy at work include improving 
the happiness level by learning to be content with the current situation moment 
by moment. This will promote positive social interaction between people where 
both individuals feel better after the connection.  

For the community, application of the Eplerian philosophy will create trust 
and responsibility because people who know who they are moment by moment 
are not thinking from their amygdala anger region or their cingulate self-centered 
region. They can be trusted to know how they will respond in all situations and 
are responsible for themselves and others. People who know who they are mo-
ment by moment give and are willing to help. Improving trust and responsibility 
in the community will result in increased positive socialization resulting in re-
ducing fear and a healthy community.  
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3. Conclusion 

The Eplerian philosophy is a model for people to know who they are moment by 
moment. People can learn to recognize the brain region that is originating their 
thoughts and learn to quickly leave harmful regions. Spending more than a few 
seconds in the amygdala anger region and the cingulate self-thinking region 
causes the cortisol stress response leading to unhealthy consequences, obtain the 
benefit of stress and neutralize. The Eplerian philosophy is for people to live 
their best lives at home, at work and in the community. 
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