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Abstract 
Grounded in general system theory, the purpose of this qualitative single case 
study was to explore strategies leaders of a small nonprofit organization in 
southern California used to grow their organization to serve a larger popula-
tion. The participants comprised 3 nonprofit leaders with documented suc-
cess at developing and growing their business. Data were collected from se-
mistructured interviews and organizational documentation. Thematic analy-
sis was used to analyze the data; 4 themes emerged: effective fundraising 
cycles, leader development, strategic planning, and long-term growth. The 
results of the study indicated nonprofit leaders create standard operating 
procedures and focus on short and long-term goals such as growth, hiring, 
and recruitment to support growth and development planning for future 
leaders. The implications for positive social change include the possibility of 
nonprofit organization leaders to offer expansion and growth strategies to in-
crease their organizations’ capacity, enabling them to positively transform 
their communities by improving and maintaining available services and add-
ing additional services. 
 

Keywords 
Baldrige Excellence Framework, Expanding Capacity, Nonprofit  
Organization (NPO), Small Business 

 

1. Background and Introduction 

The nonprofit segment has shown stable and dependable growth over the past 
decade in size and monetary gain, exceeding the growth of for-profit and gov-
ernment counterparts (Kang, 2016). The nonprofit sector has enticed the atten-
tion of researchers at the international level over the past 2 decades (Mourão, 
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Pereira, & Moreira, 2017). This attention involves the nonprofit segment’s re-
sponsibility in providing social services, a considerable economic strength for 
job establishment, and gross added value in national economies (Mourão et al., 
2017). 

Although there has been an overall increase in the nonprofit segment over the 
past decade (Kang, 2016), over the past 2 years, one in four top nonprofit leaders 
have resigned, and nearly that same number are planning to leave in the next 2 
years (Landles-Cobb, Kramer, & Milway, 2016). This break resulted from a ubi-
quitous leadership development shortage in the nonprofit sector (Landles-Cobb 
et al., 2016). Nonprofit organizations tend to function in a progressively com-
petitive environment; scholars, policymakers, and experts agree in recognizing 
that balancing money and mission becomes a primary management issue (San-
zo-Perez, Rey-García, & Álvarez-González, 2017). Understanding how to devel-
op strategies to expand capacity will assist nonprofit organization leaders when 
engaging a larger population.  

This qualitative single case study was to explore strategies leaders of a small 
nonprofit organization in southern California used to grow their organization to 
serve a larger population. The participants comprised 3 nonprofit leaders with 
documented success at developing and growing their business. This study is 
structured by Section one: the abstract, purpose statement, the research ques-
tion, assumptions, limitations, and delimitations and the literature review. In 
addition Section two contains the research structure, data collection and analy-
sis. Section three contains the findings, recommendations, and conclusion.  

2. Purpose Statement 

The purpose of this qualitative single-case study was to explore strategies non-
profit leaders use to expand their organizational capacity to serve a larger popu-
lation. The target population included senior leaders of a single nonprofit or-
ganization who effectively executed strategies to expand a nonprofit organiza-
tion’s capacity in southern California.  

3. Research Question 

The Central Research guiding this study was what strategies do nonprofit leaders 
use to expand organizational capacity to serve a larger population? Data derived 
from flexible interview questions, records, notes from the interviews, organiza-
tional documents, and the organization’s website. 

4. Assumptions, Limitations, and Delimitations 

Assumptions are precise opinions linked to the study that a scholar trusts to be 
factual or valid (Akaeze, 2016). In this study, there were three assumptions. This 
study’s first assumption was that participants would be honest, transparent, and 
upfront with their responses to the interview questions. Second, I assumed a qu-
alitative single-case study design was best for this study. Finally, I assumed using 
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the 2017-2018 Baldrige Excellence Framework and criteria to assess my client 
organization offered the best system viewpoint for evaluating the research ques-
tion. Limitations are those characteristics of a study that researchers do not con-
trol (Akaeze, 2016). Access to the participants was limited because of the geo-
graphic location. Interviews were primarily conducted over the phone. The par-
ticipants’ viewpoints may not be a true representation of other nonprofit organ-
izations in the same region.  

Delimitations denote the scope and restrictions, as set by a researcher 
(Akaeze, 2016). This study focuses on nonprofit organizations leaders’ strategies 
to expand capacity in Southern California. One delimitation of the study was the 
client’s location; all participants were from a single nonprofit organization lo-
cated in Southern California. Other areas in California were outside the bounda-
ries of the study. Other types of businesses were not in the boundaries of the 
study. Also other areas in the United States and abroad were not in the bounda-
ries of the study.  

5. Significance of the Study 

Contribution to Business Practice 
This study is of value to business practice because I provided the leadership 

perspective gained by senior leaders in expanding nonprofit organizations’ ca-
pacity. Additionally, the research results potentially point out a foundation for 
nonprofit organizations to adjust their business practices in certain areas opera-
tionally. Leaders must remain up to date on competitive business practices to 
modify and revolutionize enduring relevance (Choi, 2016). Furthermore, leaders 
from nonprofit organizations might better understand this study’s findings to 
increase support to communities, secure necessary funding, and improve effec-
tiveness. 

Implementation for Social Change 
The implications for positive social change from this study include the poten-

tial to successfully contribute to nonprofit leaders’ effective strategies to increase 
their organizational capacity. When nonprofit senior leaders effectively expand 
their capacity, it enables them to provide the support needed to serve additional 
community members. 

6. A Review of the Academic Literature 

General System Theory 
A concentrated attempt to create a general theory of systems came into being 

in the 1950s with the formation of the Society for the Advancement of General 
Systems Theory, later incorporated as the Society for General Systems Research, 
and later renamed the International Society for the Systems Sciences (Rousseau, 
2017). The society was created to pursue the implications of an influential idea 
suggested by Ludwig von Bertalanffy (Rousseau, 2017). Von Bertalanffy noted 
that in nature there are structural patterns and practical processes that persist 
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with the same form despite variations in scale and composition (Rousseau, 
2017). 

Von Bertalanffy (1950) defined GST as a theory used to determine the associ-
ation between two entities, or a system, in 1928 (Caws, 2015; von Bertalanffy, 
1950, 1953). Von Bertalanffy introduced GST in 1928 and is considered the GST 
founder, which he identified as a tool used for many problems (Caws, 2015; von 
Bertalanffy, 1950, 1953). To advance the theory, the theorist presented GST in a 
German-language periodical in 1937, with the original document remaining 
unpublished until 1945 (von Bertalanffy, 1968). Von Bertalanffy originally based 
GST on the connection among biological systems and the symbiosis between 
plant and animal communities (von Bertalanffy, 1950, 1953). A system must 
continue to be open for vigor to move and to exchange facts among two or more 
parties (von Bertalanffy, 1968). I used GST as the conceptual framework to ex-
plore strategies nonprofit leaders use to expand their organizational capacity to 
support a larger population. 

Von Bertalanffy (1953, 1968) extended systems theory by exploring connec-
tions among relationships, goals, problems, and perspectives with emphasis on 
understanding procedures both internal and external to discovered systems. 
With this growth, von Bertalanffy (1953, 1968) netted sets of objects as the sys-
tem and diverted attention to expounding and understanding difficult relation-
ships and phenomena among components. Additionally, while examining asso-
ciations between organizational wholes, von Bertalanffy (1968) concentrated on 
individualities within systems as a contributor to the common elements of the 
group. Caws (2015) solidified these findings and advances in GST from the 
viewpoint of comprehensive systems in the science crusade of pulling together 
structures and affiliations. Added advances for GST encompassed improvement 
in both theory and science as identifying and reporting on collaborations be-
tween systems (Caws, 2015). 

The framework of GST extended into the business management arena with 
the documenting of a business enterprise functioning as a social structure of 
cultural interrelationships. Human organizations and societies bear a resem-
blance to open systems inside a biological structure identified by von Bertalanffy 
(Rousseau, 2017). Human organizations and cultures contribute to nonstop de-
velopment by working together within their environments and creating various 
procedures and properties (Valentinov & Chatalova, 2014). As an alternative to 
considering organizations established exclusively on their separate components, 
scholars look through the lens of GST organizational structures (Caws, 2015). 
Through this lens, scholars explore the numerous elements within organizations 
and the collaboration of these components as an entire unit. 

Hitt, Xu, and Carnes (2016) pronounced that the use of theories, such as GST, 
aids scholars with understanding the phenomenon associated with operations 
management. The use of theories in operations management increases the re-
searcher’s capacity to offer profounder understanding about an organization’s 

https://doi.org/10.4236/ojbm.2021.92037


R. A. Stanley 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/ojbm.2021.92037 705 Open Journal of Business and Management 

 

exploration questions (Hitt et al., 2016). Ceric (2015) explored how GST added 
value, by examining it from the aspect of information communication technol-
ogy. The value generated for a business stemmed from the difficult exchanges 
among the organizational divisions and information communication technology 
(Ceric, 2015). Fantazy, Tipu, and Kumar (2016) used GST to hypothesize the 
characteristics and comparative directness of supply chains and concluded the 
effect on organizational performance. Fantazy et al. (2016) used GST lens be-
cause organizational supply chains reflect the open system viewpoint established 
within GST.  

Objects, characteristics, inner associations, and system environments are all 
critical elements of GST (von Bertalanffy, 1968). According to Broks (2016), a 
system is a series of items that intertwine to achieve a specific goal and possibly 
alter information to attain a specified outcome. Proponents of GST continue to 
solidify both values and assumptions of the theory. Even though newer theories 
shorten the title to systems theory, pivotal points revolve around world pheno-
mena as collected systems, interrelated parts, and continuous change between 
systems and the interconnected parts that encompass the entire structure (Broks, 
2016).  

Von Bertalanffy (1950, 1953) frequently encouraged his goal of assisting oth-
ers to grow into experts of the technological forces of the world, rather than vic-
tims. Von Bertalanffy (1968, 1972) concentrated on the individual as a vital ele-
ment of social organizations, while instituting efforts concerning entrenching a 
grassroots involvement in global, participative democracy with the objective of a 
progressively worldwide and comprehensive perspective in others. Von Berta-
lanffy (1950, 1953, 1968) also highlighted enlarging the system through assessing 
the process of probing goals or problems from the worldwide viewpoint and a 
variety of lenses by concentrating on developing innovative ways to establish 
connections and attain sustainability. Von Bertalanffy’s effort to move GST from 
the biological realm to the social realm was met with opposition for 16 years, but 
many scholars exhibited curiosity in the GST as a viable social theory (Caws, 
2015). 

Rousseau (2017) advanced the systems theory in the area of behavioral science 
and recognized that this theory could bring together conversations in many 
academic fields. Specifically, systems focused on both objective and subjective 
properties, along with relational approaches to an organization as a whole can 
benefit from a systems theory approach (Rousseau, 2017). Although advances 
have been made, the growth of a general theory of systems has been hampered 
by the absence of progress with classifying and refining scientific general systems 
principles that could support the methodical discovery of systems laws and de-
velopment of prognostic systems theories (Rousseau, 2017). 

The general systems theory has been projected as a basis for the amalgamation 
of science. The open systems model has enthused many new conceptualizations 
in organization theory and management practice (Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972). 
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However, experience in applying these concepts suggests numerous unresolved 
quandaries (Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972). Contingency opinions characterize steps 
toward less thought, more obvious patterns of relationships, and more applicable 
theory (Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972). Biological and social scientists commonly 
embrace systems concepts (Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972). Several organization and 
management theorists seem anxious to identify with this crusade and to contri-
bute to the development of a methodology which offer the ultimate—the merger 
of all science into one impressive conceptual model (Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972). 
The general systems theory appears to deliver a relief from the limitations of 
more mechanical methods and a justification for declining ideologies based on 
moderately closed-system thinking (Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972). This theory pro-
vides the model for organization and management theorists to crank into their 
systems model all of the varied knowledge from pertinent underlying disciplines 
(Kast & Rosenzweit, 1972).  

Undoubtedly, the complete range of thought about systems cannot be covered 
by one article (Drake & Schwarz, 2010). According to Drake and Schwarz (2010) 
they concentrated on peer-reviewed articles that were associated with scientific 
world. To explore present philosophies of GST, its presence in those articles aids 
as an instrument and gauge for discerning how GST has been advanced (Drake 
& Schwarz, 2010). Drake and Schwarz relate our more detailed investigation of 
articles to GST references relevant to science and philosophy out of 161 articles 
appearing from 1995 to 2006. Several articles deal with the applications of GST 
in areas such as engineering and management, which we do not discuss (Drake 
& Schwarz, 2010). Instead, the particular article focuses on contributions in the 
areas of science and philosophy in terms of critiques, additional developments, 
possible limitations of GST and related world views (Drake & Schwarz, 2010). 
From the beginning of GST, the purpose was to institute a formal methodology 
to be used in several scientific disciplines, just as probability theory is a mathe-
matical method that can be used in numerous fields (Drake & Schwarz, 2010). 

Scholars have advanced the theory as a study of patterns of relationships 
amongst numerous systems, fields, areas of knowledge, or subsystems (Caws, 
2015; von Bertalanffy, 1968). Progress in this area has been slow, despite signifi-
cant progress in other areas of systems science. Developments in this area have 
been slow, in spite of noteworthy progress in other areas of systems science 
(Rousseau, 2017). Today we have several systems thinking methodologies in 
management science and systems engineering, and about a dozen specialized 
systems theories, but so far, no wide-ranging systems principles that are me-
thodical in the sense of being accurate and measurable have been established 
(Rousseau, 2017). The general systems principles we do have are signified by a 
lesser variety of ideas and schemes, but the concepts are questionable, and the 
propositions are experiential and articulated in qualitative terms (Rousseau, 
2017). These ideologies offer valuable guiding alignments for making decisions 
or acting in a systemic context, but being flexible and explanatory rather than 
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precise and descriptive they do not allow the growth of predictive systems theo-
ries. 

The footsteps are noticeable as phenomena and scientific disciplines (Malecic, 
2017). Diverse scientific disciplines frequently use unlike methodologies and 
terminologies for the similar characteristics of reality (Malecic, 2017). System-
ness in nature can for example be discovered in major mechanics, science of life 
and consciousness, and chaos. More specifically, a solid contender for GST 
should disclose whether the standards of systemness in reference to the prior 
sentence are pertinent and if they should be enhanced or substituted by some 
additional systems (Malecic, 2017). General systems theory has grown in its ac-
ceptance over the previous 25 years due to its capability to serve as a worldwide 
theoretical model of existing systems, including diverse biological, social, and 
behavioral phenomena (Perry Jr., 1972). 

An analysis of some of the standards and expectations of general systems 
theory might help to disclose likely restrictions involved in its acceptance as the 
main paradigm for probing into the phenomena. Perry Jr. (1972) studied some 
of the principles and expectations of GST that: countless ideas confined in GST 
establishes a nonrefutable hypothesis which aids social philosophy to include 
those of science; the rudimentary dogma of GST are held in shared with me-
chanical functionalism making GST the topic of conversation to the comparable 
criticisms frequently connected with the functionalist method within sociology; 
and the premises of consensus, evolution, and hierarchy are rudimentary to GST 
designs created within the administrative theory (Perry Jr., 1972).  

These principles and beliefs cause theories created within the model of GST to 
be ideologically prejudiced toward an order standpoint which highlights steadi-
ness and system preservation rather than change (Perry Jr., 1972). General sys-
tems theory is not to be disparaged because it appears to have a specific value 
alignment; it has this in common with nearly every framework used for social 
inquiry (Perry Jr., 1972). 

Researchers reduced the name of the GST to systems theory, as researchers 
advanced the system into a structure to assess and categorize the world (von 
Bertalanffy, 1968). I selected the GST because of the legitimacy the theory brings 
to this study. I believe, as a foundational theory, GST is a good fit not only to 
gain an understanding on sustainable strategies, but also how systems and sub-
systems inside an organization relationship or rely on each other. Future scho-
lars might gain an understanding when using the GST as an influential theory 
for studies about capacity; however, a 21st-century theory may produce dissimi-
lar results. Additionally, using a 21st-century theory could provide prospective 
scholars with a more recent and appropriate worldview to explore sustainability. 

7. Managers and Expansion Strategy 

When considering expansion; transferring organization vision to strategy ac-
tions is the leader’s obligation, whereas business strategy employment is the duty 
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of managers and leaders’ subordinates (Saini & Sengupta, 2016). Strategy im-
plementation includes competent managers with effective performances that ac-
tivate procedures and methods for leaders desired visionary achievement (Joyce 
& Slocum, 2012). Therefore, effective strategy implementation is an element of 
the management capacities and leadership style effectiveness.  

Capacity expansion commonly necessitates large capital expenditure on liquid 
assets (Momani, Al-Hawari, & Mousa, 2016). Consequently, decisions to in-
crease capacity must support the organization’s strategic objectives and offer va-
lued input for the planning process (Momani et al., 2016). Enduring functioning 
capacity growth requires irrevocable, uneven, and prolonged investments (Mo-
mani et al., 2016). Expansion is frequently the authority of managers of multina-
tional companies (Ghorbal-Blal, 2011). Through the surge of the number of 
business elements, growth strategies are some of the most shadowed strategies of 
multinational corporations as they are often presumed to be equal to perfor-
mance (Ghorbal-Blal, 2011). Evaluating a broader variety of strategies can de-
crease risk and sponsor choices that make the most of the company’s worth 
(Ghorbal-Blal, 2011). 

Small Business 
A small business is one that typically has less than 500 employees. In 2016 

small businesses accounted for 56.8 million workers, 99.7% of all businesses, and 
50% of those employed in the United States (U.S. Small Business Administra-
tion, Office of Advocacy, 2016). The U.S. Small Business Administration, Office 
of Advocacy (2016) further defines small businesses as those organizations orga-
nized for-profit or not-for-profit; are functioned and owned independently and 
are known and can vary by industry. Normally, owners run small businesses as 
partnerships, s-corporations, or sole proprietorships. Their management follows 
precise tax guidelines (Pugna, Miclea, Negrea, & Potra, 2016; U.S. Small Business 
Administration, Office of Advocacy, 2016). 

Small business owners have an important part in the United States economy 
by producing jobs and driving modernization. The principal motive behind 
starting a new business is for the income the small business owner imagines he 
will earn from the operation of the business (Yusuf & Schindehutte, 2000). In-
come is likely if the business can make a profit by earning more resources than it 
takes to operate the business. The business owner must center more on the 
business’s strong points and put less emphasis on the rest (Lan, Bo, & Baozhen, 
2014). Factors that are a part of small business performance include, but are not 
limited to owner and manager characteristics, business strategy, and business 
characteristics (Blackburn, Hart, & Wainwright, 2013). 

The business owner’s choices about where and what to concentrate on pro-
duce the organization’s business strategy. The business strategy is how the or-
ganizations’ leaders align the business with its surroundings to establish and 
sustain a competitive advantage by making the most of its assets, resources, and 
competencies in a complete manner (Gumusluoglu & Acur, 2016; Palmer, 
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Wright, & Powers, 2001). Small business owners should align their limited capi-
tal to those activities that improve their business strategies (Blackburn et al., 
2013; Lan et al., 2014). Some small business activities that improve small busi-
ness strategies may be financial, commercial, and in some cases may be ethical 
(Garza, 2013). Small businesses leaders within an organization take control of 
the resources for human and physical capital (Campbell & Park, 2017). No mat-
ter how you define a business and the difference between employee level and to-
tal assets, these companies increase and stabilize the national economies (Leo-
nidou, Christodoulides, Kyrgidou, & Palihawadana, 2017). Celec and Globocnik 
(2017) postulated that smaller organizations contribute to nationwide economies 
and are causes of economic growth. The income generation is a significant rea-
son to get involved with small business operations and as business revenue sur-
passes operating expenditures, revenues surge, which ultimately drives accom-
plishment (Baumol, 2015). 

8. Nonprofit Organizations 

Nonprofit organizations support the community in noteworthy ways for exam-
ple they depend heavily on philanthropic and government resourcing it is be-
coming more difficult to sustain, specifically in the wake of economic declines 
(Stecker, 2014). The presentation of social entrepreneurial ideologies, including 
social enterprise activities, can increase the sustainability of nonprofits’ business 
model while strengthening management capacity and enhancing mission 
(Stecker, 2014). There are more than 1.4 million active nonprofits organizations 
in the United States, vying for scarcer and scarcer dollars, nonprofits must pur-
sue new funding sources (Stecker, 2014). 

Failure of Nonprofit Organizations 
There are numerous theories or arguments why nonprofit organizations, 

known as the third sector, were created (Siddiqui, 2018). We call this sector (vo-
luntary, philanthropic, non-governmental, and nonprofit) fluctuations depend-
ing upon the viewpoint. Unfortunately, this segment’s vital component has been 
lost in our journey for superior legitimacy through lawful and managerial classi-
fication (Siddiqui, 2018). Several nonprofit organizations obtain grants, gifts, or 
donations with a restriction (Gilbert, 2017). Nonprofit organizational leaders 
receive donations but should prove these grants or donations followed legal and 
ethical guidelines (Gilbert, 2017). When funding or gifts are received, this is the 
best time to create a process that tracks these restricted gifts or grants that dem-
onstrate how the money was applied to the intended item (Gilbert, 2017). No 
nonprofit leader wants to deal with an audit and not have documents to support 
their donations and how they were used (Gilbert, 2017). Unfortunately, non-
profit organizations’ leadership does not discuss these issues until it is too late 
(Gilbert, 2017). This often leads to the failure of nonprofit organizations. Just 
like nonprofit organizations not all small businesses succeed after 5 years as ap-
proximately 50% fail, and 30% remain in business at the 10-year mark (Hibb-
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ler-Britt & Sussan, 2015). The ability to remain in business may increase over 
time if businesses can continue beyond the 5 years and, and if the national 
economy impact organizational efforts (U.S. Small Business Administration, Of-
fice of Advocacy, 2016). Possible failure issues during the beginning phase of 
small business start-ups comprise limited funding, minimal management skills, 
failure to have a proper strategic plan in place, and the failure of management to 
retain the right mix of employees (Bennett, 2016). According to Bennett (2016) 
there are certain requirements and competencies that are vital for long-term 
business success, and its essential that they are in place from the inception of 
operations. According to Manso (2017), concentrating on innovation points out 
risk-taking as a share of small business processes. With the way technology is 
expanding, comprehending technological innovation risk tolerance will assist 
with long-term success and performance. Maintaining the proper human capital, 
longer contracts, also aids long-term success instead of business failure (Manso, 
2017). 

If strategic planning is not accomplished, to include thoroughly focusing on 
detailed business strategies, diminished company fiscal performance follows 
(Bennett, 2016; Mellat-Parast, Golmohammadi, McFadden, & Miller, 2015). 
Reduced financial performance, connected to unstable economies coupled with 
augmented unemployment, is an additional business failure sign (Sassen, 2016). 
Monelos, Sanchez, and Lopez (2014) gathered the information for small to me-
dium business failure prediction models and attested fiscal performance as a 
prime business failure indicator. Additional failure measures include overdue 
financial payments, approval of diminished employee qualifications, and an ab-
sence of quality values (Monelos et al., 2014). In addition to the monetary side of 
small business failure, lapses in understanding growth; functioning processes; 
management processes; accepting market space and market share; and customer 
buying behaviors also contribute to small business failures (Cavan, 2016; Choi, 
Rupasingha, Robertson, & Green Leigh, 2017; Luo & Stark, 2015). 

Business success is not a guarantee or programmed; probable causes for fail-
ure could offer an opportunity for success. The more the competition, the more 
sales are decreased, and location and inadequate technology all contribute to busi-
ness failures (Choi et al., 2017; Franca, de Aragao Gomes, Machado, & Russo, 2014). 
Integrating transformational business processes, employing ground-breaking tech-
nology, and reducing tangible asset acquisitions, smaller organization leaders 
may thrust small business existence beyond 5 years (Franca et al., 2014). Addi-
tionally, understanding business failure drawbacks before beginning the process 
of closing the business is also vital (Coad, 2014). Precise variables describe fail-
ure in the business segment; these variables can be restrained, and provide fun-
damentals for accomplishment versus failure (Scherger, Vigier, & Barbe-
ra-Marine, 2014; Wang, Gopal, Shankar, & Pancras, 2015). By understanding the 
details for failure, organization leaders may fend off business closure and thrust 
the company into long-term success.  
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9. Research Method and Design 

Research Method 
I used the qualitative research method to explore organizational expansion 

strategies for a developed, small nonprofit organization conducting business in 
southern California. Scholars use qualitative research methods to collect infor-
mation and explore the phenomenon of individuals and groups (Park & Park, 
2016). The qualitative study method is unlike the quantitative research method 
because of science, answering what, and testing hypotheses for arithmetic mea-
surements (Lincoln & Guba, 1985; Park & Park, 2016). Qualitative research en-
tails an in-depth analysis of the structural processes and people without a prede-
termined bias. Scholars using the qualitative research method can attain infor-
mation from contributors when using numerous data-gathering instruments. 
Qualitative data are narrative in nature and help discover individuals’ lived ex-
periences (Ross, Iguchi, & Panicker, 2018). 

Understanding the difference between qualitative and quantitative research is 
vital when selecting the proper research method to address a research question. 
Qualitative studies can include discovering delicate issues using semistructured 
interviews to garner vital information from contributors (Yazan, 2015).  

Research Design 
I selected a single case study design for this study. Researchers choosing the 

case study method seek to examine and address the how, what, and why of con-
tributors’ understandings and insights within their usual context (Ridder, 2017). 
According to Yin (2018), there are four types of case study design: 1) embedded 
multiple units of analysis design, 2) holistic single unit, 3) multiple case design, 
and 4) single-case design. Saunders, Lewis, and Thornhill (2015) stated that a 
single case study enables a scholar to gain a detailed understanding of the con-
tributors. The single case study is a set of procedures and processes used to 
gather, examine, and measure variables being discovered or observed in the re-
search problem (Alavi, Archibald, McMaster, Lopez, & Cleary, 2018). According 
to Guetterman and Fetters (2018), the research design’s objective is to address 
the research question and advance a particular idea. 

Single case studies involve researchers using questions without restraints to 
help motivate contributors to provide widespread answers to well-established 
questions (Windsong, 2018), which aids in reaching data saturation. Data satu-
ration is when the same scholar or other scholars can reproduce the outcomes 
when they duplicate a study with different contributors (Marshall & Rossman, 
2016). Data saturation aids in ensuring the validity of a study. Failure to reach 
data saturation has an undesirable effect on the validity and quality (Fusch & 
Ness, 2015). In this study, I interviewed until I confirmed data saturation when 
no additional information or topics arose. 

10. Population and Sampling 

The populace I selected for my first sample of contributors was from a small 
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nonprofit organization operating in southern California. I used a purposeful 
sampling method consisting of three to five participants for this study. The sam-
ple size depends on the purpose of a study and the number of contributors re-
quired to answer the research question (Saunders et al., 2015). Duan, Bhaumik, 
Palinkas, and Hoagwood (2014) stated that purposeful sampling finds mutual 
patterns to articulate and assess assumptions. Researchers should choose the 
sample size with the highest chance of reaching data saturation (Marshall & 
Rossman, 2016). I confirmed that I reached data saturation by interviewing sev-
eral contributors until no new information emerged. 

I used purposeful sampling for this study as it aligned with the direction and 
intent of the study. Purposeful sampling frequently befalls before gathering data, 
while theoretical sampling happens in combination with data collection (Yazan, 
2015). Using purposeful sampling is a justified method when the sample popu-
lace was visible and well-defined (Fusch & Ness, 2015). I established a weekly 
communication with the senior leader via phone conference throughout the ser-
vice agreement. Telephone interviews and document reviews were the principal 
methods for gathering data for qualitative case studies (Ridder, 2017). In qualita-
tive studies, numerous contacts with contributors are essential to guarantee data 
saturation, as scholars regulate recommendations and new themes (Saunders et 
al., 2015). I associated the interview questions with the 2018 Baldrige Excellence 
Performance Framework. I studied the data to ensure that saturation had indeed 
occurred with the contributors. Once data and information were collected from 
semistructured conferences, and evaluation of company material revealed no 
new information, data saturation occurred. 

11. Data Collection Instruments 

In qualitative research, the scholar, in many cases, is the principal instrument for 
collecting data (Ridder, 2017; Van den Berg & Struwig, 2017). I served as the 
primary data collection, data storage, and data analysis instrument for this qua-
litative single case study. Researchers gather data utilizing different qualitative 
research methods, including but not limited to interviews, transcripts, or focus 
group discussions (Ridder, 2017). I collected data from flexible interview ques-
tions, records, and notes from the interviews, organizational documents, and the 
organization’s website. The research questions and objectives decided methods 
to collect data and how to creatively use the data (Gummer & Mandinach, 2015). 

I used the 2017-2018 Baldrige Performance Excellence Framework to attain a 
well-rounded understanding of its processes and their performance that im-
pacted its growth strategy. Scholars use the Baldrige Performance Excellence 
Framework to collect data in the following areas: 1) customers; 2) workforce; 3) 
operations; 4) knowledge management, analysis and 5) leadership; 6) customer; 
and 7) results (Walden University, 2017). I conducted open-ended interviews 
with all contributors. Each interview’s average time was 30 minutes in length, 
and I added additional time if needed. Researchers were leading interviews to 
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place an interviewing protocol before the interviews to guarantee consistency 
with the interviewing process (Windsong, 2018). The interview protocol outline 
comprised of multiple stages, which included 1) utilizing an associate tracking 
system for accuracy, 2) obtain and examine discussions amongst researcher and 
contributor, 3) thorough outline of the interview protocol with all contributors, 
and 4) ensure the interview questions aligned with the research question. I 
maintained this qualitative single case study’s integrity by following the member 
checking and the interview protocol. 

12. Data Collection Techniques 

The process of collecting data included searching for strategies that nonprofit 
leaders use to increase capacity. The data collection method chosen for this qua-
litative single case study was semistructured telephonic interviews, transcript re-
views, notes, e-mails, the organization’s website, and additional supporting do-
cumentation. Researchers use interviews to discover workplace complexities in 
more considerable depth than reviewing documents that have been archived 
(Boddy, 2016). Researchers’ record in-person and telephone interviews to get a 
greater understanding of the contributor views and ensure accuracy when orga-
nizing records for analysis (Phillips, Borry, & Shabani, 2017). Before the inter-
view sessions, I sent e-mails to ensure the date and time were correct. Interviews 
were conducted by telephone as the principal method of gathering information 
from each contributor. I ensured the semistructured interview questions’ align-
ment with the topic and the 2017-2018 Baldrige Excellence Framework. 

Researchers must recognize that utilizing interviews as the primary data col-
lection technique has both advantages and disadvantages. For example, con-
ducting contributor interviews is a critical task, and researchers must allot suffi-
cient time and training to gain proficiency. Some of the best researchers have an 
issue with being personally bias and preserving the interview protocol (Wind-
song, 2018). Robinson (2014) posited semistructured interview is an asset in 
conducting qualitative case study research. Researchers and contributors might 
participate in noteworthy pontification throughout semistructured interviews 
(Miracle, 2016). A review of company documents offers added information 
through the methodological triangulation process (Yin, 2018). Additionally, I 
reviewed internal and external documents to include the company’s financial 
report, website, and notes from interviews to better understand the organization 
and its potential for increasing capacity. 

Yin (2018) conveyed that document reviews can offer added support to im-
prove interview accurateness. Conversely, Windsong (2018) contended that 
countless researchers lack the experience of reviewing many documents because 
of the time it takes and the cost. Varpio and Meyer (2017) conducted research 
and suggested members check to ensure the research results’ validity to the con-
tributor’s experience. The member checking process I used allowed contributors 
to authenticate my interpretation of their answers from the semistructured in-
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terviews. 

13. Data Analysis 

Ganapathy (2016) posited researchers use a qualitative data analysis process to 
gain knowledge of new ideas and improve their understanding of the phenome-
non. Fusch and Ness (2015) stated that to gain data saturation, researchers use 
methodological triangulation. Methodological triangulation boosts reliability 
using numerous data sources to pinpoint new themes (Ganapathy, 2016). Re-
searchers can use several data sources to reference data and guarantee correct-
ness from semistructured interviews and historical documents (Windsong, 
2018). Researchers frequently triangulate data as part of their data collection 
strategy, where the details of the outcomes are in the case description (Ridder, 
2017). 

For this study, I used methodological triangulation to explore the data from 
semistructured interviews, historical data, financial reports, social media, and 
company websites. I translated the interview recordings at the end of each ses-
sion and did associate checking to ensure I received each participant’s proper 
message. After studying the internal and external data and translating the inter-
view questions, I recorded the raw data utilizing excel and a color-coding 
process. Researchers choose a coding process to categorize and develop themes 
from transcripts and shape and highlight qualitative data (Kroll, 2017; Vaughn & 
Turner, 2016). Using color-coding helped to create a narrative and the most 
important themes of the study. Coding is a simple but adaptable and respectable 
instrument that enables researchers to reorganize the raw data into groups for 
the phase of the analysis (Saunders et al., 2015). I studied the data sources, and 
methodological triangulation enabled me to explore leaders’ ability to increase 
their capacity in a small nonprofit organization. 

I maintained awareness of personal biases, kept an open mind, and was recep-
tive to new information because of my knowledge of and working with other 
nonprofit organizations. Member checking was used during the data analysis 
phase to ensure the correctness of the information. Irvine and Irvine (2016) po-
sited that researchers conduct data analysis to contribute to the field of study by 
incorporating scholarly literature and new themes from case studies. Researchers 
show a relationship between the findings with the literature and conceptual 
framework to validate, invalidate, and extend the existing literature (Marshall & 
Rossman, 2016). I used the 2017-2018 Baldrige Excellence Framework to gather 
and recognize new themes and arrange the results with the conceptual frame-
work and literature that contribute to increasing a small nonprofit organization’s 
capacity. 

14. Reliability and Validity 

Abdalla, Oliveira, Azevedo, and Gonzalez (2018) suggested to have value in qua-
litative research; researchers implement procedures to guarantee credibility, 
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transferability, confirmability, and reliability in the research study. Biases surge 
when a scholar discovers how challenging it is to measure the quality of the 
study (East, 2016). Establishing trustworthiness in qualitative research helps re-
searchers to improve reliability in the research methods and results as well as 
lessens bias and errors (Yin, 2018). Integrating procedural strategies in qualita-
tive research enhances the study’s reliability (Noble & Smith, 2015). Reliability 
dictates precisely how to address dependability (Windsong, 2018). Reliability is a 
vital characteristic of research superiority, and it is not adequate alone to ensure 
good quality research (Saunders et al., 2015). Case study researchers must con-
firm reliability by observing the case study databases and protocols (Yazan, 
2015). Following an interview protocol aids in improving the reliability of the 
case study research by managing the data collection process (Yin, 2018). This 
study’s reliability started with a determined sampling method to acquire useful 
data related to the phenomenon. 

I enhanced the dependability of this study by utilizing methodological trian-
gulation and member checking. Member checking verifies the correctness of da-
ta gathered, improves validity, and establishes trust in the research process 
(Chen, 2016; Debono, Greenfield, Testa, Mumford, Hogden, Pawsey, & Braith-
waite, 2017; Thomas, 2017; Varpio & Meyer, 2017). Member checking in this 
study enabled contributors to guarantee explanations made sense in the way 
they aligned with their lived experience. Dependability is an equivalent condi-
tion to the reliability to track developing changes to a phenomenon and account 
for how others can comprehend and assess the data (Lewis, 2015). Researchers 
can triangulate semistructured coded data, notes, documents, and interviews to 
improve qualitative research consistency (Saldana, 2015). Additionally, member 
authentication and collaboration are vital in qualitative research (Levy, 2015). 
Data saturation includes interviewing sufficient contributors to a point in which 
no new information or themes appear (Fusch & Ness, 2015). I reached data sa-
turation upon completing the interviews of three contributors. I gathered data 
from the interview questions and reviewed transcripts to effect reliability 
through the interview protocol process, ensuring reliability and questions that 
were asked were unrestricted for all participants. Member checking enabled the 
participants to guarantee their responses made sense. If researchers are encour-
aging participants to take part in member checking, the researcher must present 
the analyzed data in a rewarding way (Birt, Scott, Cavers, Campbell, & Walter, 
2016). Reaching data saturation will help assure the dependability of the find-
ings. 

This study aimed to explore dependable and valid processes and data that re-
duce the chance of bias and misinterpretation. Noble and Smith (2015) posited 
bias in research diminutions the validity and reliability of the study. Researchers 
that gather data from several sources increase the validity and reduce bias (Chi-
niara & Bentein, 2016; Starr, 2014). Likewise, researchers utilize internal and ex-
ternal validity methods to establish data accuracy (Ridder, 2017). Researchers 
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can improve credibility by member reviewing contributors’ transcripts, through 
triangulation, interview protocol, and data interpretation (Marshall & Rossman, 
2016). I established qualitative credibility by way of member checking of data 
interpretation, triangulation. I tracked the interview protocol to ensure my 
summary represented the phenomenon from the participants’ standpoint and 
document analysis. 

Prolonged research includes building relationships, trustworthiness, and ga-
thering adequate data (Park & Park, 2016). Researchers can improve confirma-
bility by adequately verifying outcomes (Mihaela, 2017). I ensured confirmabili-
ty by asking meaningful questions throughout the interview process and suc-
ceeding with member checking of the questioning, data interpretation, and tri-
angulation. Adjusting external validity to qualitative research is challenging be-
cause the small sample size reduces the transferring of studies (Saunders et al., 
2015). Collecting information from several sources, transcribing notes from the 
interview, using an interview protocol, and having ABC evaluate my findings 
enabled me to reduce bias. 

Kroll (2017) suggested that researchers attain the dependability of a qualitative 
study once other readers have the chance to determine the transferability of the 
study. Yin (2018) concluded that thoroughness is a vital element of qualitative 
research because it necessitates researchers to apply current philosophies, use 
existing literature, and add data that reinforces the qualitative research and pro-
pose better awareness for future researchers. The GST includes a feasible way to 
quantify a company’s accomplishments. General System Theory maintained the 
value that nonprofit organization leaders placed on increasing their nonprofit 
organization’s capacity more significant than the present capacity and under-
standing the problematic structures essential to withstand long-term development 
and profitability. 

15. Findings 

Product and Process Results 
ABC is a nonprofit organization that operates in southern California for over 

20 years. This business location was established to support the immediate needs 
of the community and assist families in need. This business location is looking to 
expand its capacity to serve more families and provide more services to the 
community.  

ABC strives to create change in the community through persistent advocacy 
and outstanding customer service. The leaders of ABC always remain active in 
the community by ensuring those in need are well informed. ABC leaders re-
main relevant in the community by providing single mothers and fathers who 
have the appropriate skills they require to become self-sufficient and their child-
ren exposed to proper nutrition and healthy living. At this business location, 
ABC established work processes are operating efficiently and effectively because 
the disciplined staff are ensuring they are utilizing best practices, understanding 
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their clients’ needs, and ensuring they are following the applicable safety meas-
ures when dealing with clients. 

Customer Results 
ABC leadership has established an effective and efficient system for excellent 

customer services and listening to customer’s needs. These systems were estab-
lished with ABC mission and vision in mind. The leaders of ABC screen feed-
back from customers and follow industry trends to improve their future growth 
strategies. The most important growth step at this business location is opening a 
store where clients can purchase clothes and other items at a reduced cost. This 
has helped ABC to expand their brand and increase its customer base. ABC con-
tinues to impact the local community by reducing unemployment and improv-
ing family’s quality of life with the service they provide. To ensure this business 
location, to ensure they hear their clients’ voice, they use various platforms such 
as Facebook, Instagram, and the organization website.  

Workforce Results 
Leadership at this business location reviewed results related to workforce 

safety, hiring, and recruiting efforts. Workforce result indicators for capacity and 
capability might include staffing across the organization and employee qualifica-
tions to meet professional development requirements (Baldrige Performance 
Excellence Framework, 2018). At this business location, the leadership built a 
culture of trust by openly sharing workforce performance data and a vision for 
their employees’ future growth strategies. The leaders of ABC at the location are 
heavily involved in developing and engaging with their workforce. The leader-
ship is genuine about their organizational culture and well-being. The adminis-
tration at this business location continuously considered the capacity and capa-
bilities of their workforce. 

Leadership and Governance Results 
This business location does not have a governing board of directors. The ex-

ecutive director is responsible for ABC’s oversight and functions, and he devel-
ops policies for running the organization. The leadership is thoroughly involved 
with the day-to-day operations of the organization. The Executive Director in-
volves the other leaders in the organization with strategic planning and commu-
nicating the workforce’s outcomes and other stakeholders. Amenability with 
rules and regulations, tax laws, child development, social workers, employees, 
and their working conditions, and the terms and conditions of the SLAs are ad-
hered to within the organization. 

Ethically, ABC’s leaders have established processes and procedures in place 
for business operations and interacting with the stakeholders. There are gauges 
in place for assessing leadership communication, ethically engaging with clients, 
interactions with the staff, compliance with laws, rules, and regulations are 
clearly defined. Best practices are put in place, along with business processes 
within the organization. This business location has a semi operational Facebook 
sight; they perform collaborative community services for families and conduct 
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resident meetings within the high desert communities in Southern California. 
Financial and Market Results 
Business leaders at this location are attentive to the financial and market re-

sults of their organization. ABC leadership has put in place measures to track 
marketplace financial performance and their performance in the market. These 
indicators or measures are evident in ABC for measuring economic perfor-
mance, market performance, and strategic execution. Just like with any organi-
zation, the financial goals of ABC have met some challenges. These goals include 
the purposes of the company and its programs. Every year, the goals for cost ef-
ficiency, grants, partnerships, and increasing donors’ number are met.  

Leadership endlessly monitors the execution of the strategic initiatives sche-
duled every financial year and has always accomplished its implementation 
goals. ABC had a revenue budget of USD 595 thousand in 2018, which they 
achieved except for the 2017 financial year. In ABC, every USD invested in a 
family produces a return of three USD to the society reducing the requirement 
for public assistance, increases taxable earning, and cost savings from crime re-
duction. Every USD invested in early childhood nurturing and education saves 
10 USD in social costs. 

Key Themes 
A vital component of this study is understanding what essential processes the 

leaders of ABC are using and how efficient these processes are. The key themes 
include the process strengths and process opportunities for process improve-
ment utilizing the four factors for assessing processes: integration, learning, ap-
proach, and deployment. These themes for process improvement were attained 
after using categories one through six of the 2017-2018 Baldrige Excellence 
Framework and Criteria. The key themes from the results’ opportunities and 
strengths for results improvement result from using four evaluation elements: 
integration, comparisons, trends, and levels. 

Deployment is the approach that can be used across processes, and learning 
includes using intuition for impacting endless changes while being united 
among various components within an organization (Baldrige Performance Ex-
cellence Framework, 2018). An approach is made up of methods used to satisfy a 
process and must be repeatable, appropriate, and effective with the proper in-
formation (Baldrige Performance Excellence Framework, 2018). Comparison 
across organizations and the degree to which the result measures and spread 
over various actions, customers, processes, and products are comparison and 
integration, respectively (Baldrige Performance Excellence Framework, 2018). 
Levels and trends are the measurable performance and rate of performance en-
hancement, respectively (Baldrige Performance Excellence Framework, 2018). 
The alignment of a method with company needs and the degree to which 
processes, plans, measures, and other elements are synchronized within the or-
ganizations is assimilation (Baldrige Performance Excellence Framework, 2018). 

Process Strengths. Process strengths are a vital aspect for ABC to expand 
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beyond its current capacity. Their mission, vision support their processes and 
values, supporting their workforce, customers, collaborators, and stakeholders. 
Leadership supports the workforce, partners, suppliers, and stakeholders. ABC 
Leadership promotes widespread legal and ethical, responsibility amongst all 
members within the organization. Leaders within ABC provide a full spectrum 
of support to strengthen their communities. 

ABC processes intend to support the achievement of the strategic objectives, 
pinpoint, and exploit strategic opportunities. ABC processes support and assist 
the workforce in capitalizing on its strategic advantages against a set of goals. 
The procedures are appropriately developed to help the leaders in the practical 
usage and distribution of the organization’s resources. The performance metrics 
or measures are well-defined for the workforce, communities, customers, lea-
dership, strategic partners, service and support programs, operations, knowledge 
management, and results; and these measures and metrics are effective. 

At this business location, the leaders understand that the voice of the custom-
er’s needs an identity and assessment. At this business location, meeting the 
needs of the customers is to be expected because the processes are developed to 
run effectively and efficiently. The methods around identifying, designing, eva-
luating, and providing quality programs to customers are accurately defined in 
ABC. They are determined to be useful as well as aligning with the organiza-
tion’s objectives. Also, there are thorough processes for constant learning and 
performance enhancement throughout the organization at this business location. 
The employees at this business location are engaged, satisfied, and motivated 
because of the process efficiency and effectiveness that have been put in place. 
The procedures are identified for workforce accomplishment, accessing benefits, 
and safety working efficiently and effectively. 

Process Opportunities. Process strengths are a vital aspect for ABC to ex-
pand beyond its current capacity. Their processes are supported by their mis-
sion, vision, and values, supporting their workforce, customers, collaborators, 
and stakeholders. Leadership supports the workforce, partners, suppliers, and 
stakeholders. ABC Leadership promotes widespread legal and ethical, responsi-
bility amongst all members within the organization. Leaders within ABC provide 
a full spectrum of support to strengthen their communities. 

ABC processes are intended to support the achievement of the strategic objec-
tives, pinpoint, and exploit strategic opportunities. ABC processes support and 
assist the workforce in capitalizing on its strategic advantages against a set of 
goals. The procedures are appropriately developed to help the leaders in the 
practical usage and distribution of the organization’s resources. The perfor-
mance metrics or measures are well-defined for the workforce, communities, 
customers, leadership, strategic partners, service and support programs, opera-
tions, knowledge management, and results; and these measures and metrics are 
effective. 

At this business location, the leaders understand that the voice of the custom-

https://doi.org/10.4236/ojbm.2021.92037


R. A. Stanley 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/ojbm.2021.92037 720 Open Journal of Business and Management 

 

er’s needs an identity and assessment. At this business location, meeting the 
needs of the customers is to be expected because the processes are developed to 
run effectively and efficiently. The methods around identifying, designing, eva-
luating, and providing quality programs to customers are accurately defined in 
ABC. They are determined to be useful as well as aligning with the organiza-
tion’s objectives. Also, there are thorough processes for constant learning and 
performance enhancement throughout the organization at this business location. 
The employees at this business location are engaged, satisfied, and motivated 
because of the process efficiency and effectiveness that have been put in place. 
The procedures are identified for workforce accomplishment, accessing benefits, 
and safety working efficiently and effectively. 

Results Strength. At this business location, the leadership’s business strengths 
included 1) strong leadership, 2) mentorship, and 3) over 20 years of program 
performance. ABCs flexibility enables them to change courses when needed, ad-
just as the industry changes, and make sound decisions without a governing 
body’s approval. At this business location, ABC leadership’s energetic involve-
ment within the community contributes to business familiarity, visibility across 
the community, and product advertising. This business location has a thrift store 
where donations from the store helped offset costs to families through store cre-
dit. 

Results accomplishment is emerged in and across ABC and connected from 
customers and products to organizational processes, strategic plans, and goals. 
Based on the results from semistructured interviews, business plan, and the Bal-
drige Performance Excellence Framework (2018), I determined that ABC lea-
dership provided sound leadership in the areas of professional conduct and per-
sonal readiness. Building on the GST as the conceptual framework of this study, 
I learned that there is significant and robust communication amongst staff and 
leaders, which has contributed to the organization’s resounding success. Anoth-
er critical finding identified at the business location should include training for 
the next generation to take over and sustain the business. I also concluded that 
one person is making all the decisions on long-term growth strategy execution, 
which is hugely limiting. 

Results Opportunities. ABC leaders at this business location have effective 
and efficient systems in place within the organization. The leadership must im-
prove the measurement and execution of employees’ chances for engagement 
and leadership development and eliminating one person from making all the de-
cisions. The leaders at this business location have measures for measuring cus-
tomer satisfaction internally, but it is essential to define external customer satis-
faction. Additionally, leadership must outline future capacity and capability 
needs for the workforce. Learning and growth system, an outline for identifying 
changes in the workforce’s knowledge, skills, and abilities, needs to be developed 
by the leadership. These objectives will energize leaders in the right direction in 
achieving these elements of survival and growth. 
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16. Applications to Professional Practice 

Nonprofit organizations contribute considerably to the growth of communities 
and the welfare of the community. These contributions to society are through 
their favorable social change policies and programs they operate (Stephan, Pat-
terson, Kelly, & Mair, 2016). The majority of small- and medium-sized enter-
prises tend to go out of business within 5 years after being established (Ifekwem 
& Adedamola, 2016). At this business location, the leadership wants to grow and 
expand the capacity of the organization. In this study, I explored strategies that 
nonprofit business leaders use to grow and develop their organizational capacity. 
Four themes emerged: effective fundraising cycles, leader development, strategic 
planning, and long-term growth. Nonprofit business leaders can use the infor-
mation from this single-case study to explore effective strategies leaders of a 
nonprofit organization use to expand their capacity. The growth of small mature 
nonprofit organizations is vital to the local community’s development and 
growth (Greenspan & Wooldridge, 2018). To increase capacity, nonprofit lead-
ers need to build and implement strategies for sustainability and long-term 
growth. 

Growth is the most vital characteristic of small business sustainability, prod-
uctivity, and profitability (Bello & Ivanov, 2014). Each contributor in this study 
provided valued vision into short- and long-term growth strategies. The results 
of the data collected from three contributors supported characteristics of the 
2018 Baldrige Excellence Framework that are vital to organizational perfor-
mance enhancement, which is: 1) leadership; 2) strategy; 3) customer; 4) mea-
surement, analysis, and knowledge management; 5) operations; and 6) results. 
Business leaders reviewing the data in this case study may increase their know-
ledge on the strategies they can use to develop and expand a nonprofit business. 
Small business leaders may also garner an understanding of staff engagement 
methods and succession planning. Business leaders using the outcomes of this 
study to implement growth strategies might improve their organization’s per-
formance, capacity, sustainability, profitability, increase local tax revenue, and 
reduce unemployment. Using survival strategies recommended in this study, 
leaders can continue to impact social change strategies that benefit communities, 
the environment, families, and society. 

17. Implication for Social Change 

An implication for social change consists of offering small nonprofit businesses 
leaders with growth strategies to increase capacity above their current size. ABC 
contributes to improved families’ ability to care for their families and reduce 
unemployment in the community. The growth of small businesses beyond year 
one is vital for the sustainment of an organization (Morgan & Sisak, 2016). In 
2015, small businesses accounted for 97.6% of organizations that exported 
goods, and 32.9% of the identified export value (U.S. Small Business Adminis-
tration, Office of Advocacy, 2017). Most new businesses do not survive past the 
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first 5 years; thus, reducing the tax revenue (Decker, Haltiwanger, Jarmin, & 
Miranda, 2014). 

The growth strategies outlined in this study could assist leaders of small non-
profit organizations in the development and implementation of short- and 
long-term goals to grow their organization beyond its capacity. The results of 
this qualitative single case study might also inspire leaders of small businesses to 
look for growth opportunities outside their comfort level, thus providing job 
growth, stability, and more contributions to local tax revenue. 

18. Recommendations for Further Action 

I recommend that ABC leaders use the data gathered from the Baldrige Perfor-
mance Excellence Framework (2018) to develop their strengths, strengthen their 
weaknesses, benefit from opportunities presented to them, and limit external 
and internal threats. Qualitative researchers conducting parallel consulting case 
studies may benefit from completing a multiple case study of mature nonprofit 
organizations. I recommend that researchers understand the lack of growth 
strategies among nonprofit business leaders using various conceptual frame-
works. I also recommend researchers contemplate using a multiple case study 
design to affirm the strategies that nonprofit leaders use to expand and grow 
their organization. The use of a multiple case study design will help researchers 
gain a broader knowledge of the strategies to expand and develop a nonprofit 
business in the western region of the United States, which will help in positively 
converting individuals, organizations, communities, the environment, and so-
cieties. 

The recommendation given to ABC may help create a succession and growth 
strategic plan. At this business location, the executive director might seek to en-
gage younger employees to determine their aspirations to learn management 
and leadership skills to sustain the business. The executive director at this busi-
ness location might also consider training one of the current managers or hiring 
an additional manager to assist with running the day-to-day operations, freeing 
time for him to focus on succession and growth planning.  

The results from this qualitative, single case study might contribute to the 
betterment of the organization and community practices of a small nonprofit 
organization. The influence on business practice contains the data and informa-
tion garnered from using the Malcolm Baldrige Performance Excellence 
Framework on a small nonprofit business operating in the southern California. 
Social change contributions include increased tax revenue, lower unemploy-
ment, personal development, the betterment of families, and promoting business 
growth in the community. 

This study’s outcomes might contribute to positive social change by informing 
leaders of nonprofit organizations of the strategies for growth and expansion of 
their organization, which are necessary for long-term sustainability. Nonprofit 
organizations are a civil society with considerable influences on communities by 
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making policies, innovation, cost-effectiveness, and participating in local com-
munities’ and public events (Appe, 2019). 

19. Conclusion 

Expansion and growth strategies secure long-term sustainability for nonprofit 
organizations. In this study, the leaders of nonprofit organizations posited that 
nonprofit leaders are looking for growth and expansion needed to employ effec-
tive strategic succession planning. Effective strategic succession planning is 
made up of defining long-term objectives, the definition of an implementation 
strategy, focused determination, environmental scanning, short-term goals, and 
evaluation and control of subsequent changes (Roth, 2015). Fundraising and 
strategic planning are parts of the strategies noted for the growth and expansion 
of a nonprofit business. A fundraising plan helps nonprofit organizations to ac-
complish their mission and is made up of three elements, which are 1) where we 
are? 2) Where do we want to be? and 3) How are we going to get there? (Sar-
geant & Shang, 2017). Additionally, Sargeant and Shang (2017) pointed out that 
the components of a fundraising strategy are the overall direction, segmentation, 
and positioning. 

Also, fundraising strategies chart a path of how a fundraising plan can be ac-
complished. Any nonprofit organization looking to achieve its goal of making a 
beneficial impact on society must have an effective fundraising strategy and 
plan. Tangible resources and financial valuation are additional strategies leaders 
use to expand the capacity of a nonprofit business. Human capital is one of the 
corporeal resources that systematizes other classes of resources to provide prod-
ucts. Assessments are desirable aspects of quality enhancement in any company 
(Gökalp & Demirörs, 2017). Nonprofit organizations’ leadership must repeated-
ly assess their tangible and monetary resources to continue to impact quality 
improvements inside their organization. 

Leadership in nonprofit organizations uses positive work environments and 
team development as strategies to expand and grow their organization. Team ef-
fectiveness has two significant components, which are team development and 
team performance. Team effectiveness leads to efficient use of resources, im-
proved productivity, increased innovation, improved problem-solving, im-
proved decision-making, and better-quality products and services (Northouse, 
2016). Leaders of nonprofit organizations pursuing growth and expansion, even 
sustainability, need to make team development a priority in their organization. 
Effective team development leads to effective communication, better collabora-
tion, and efficient teamwork (Suprapto, 2017). Employees’ performance in or-
ganizations improves with team effectiveness, joined with communication and 
cooperation (Suprapto, 2017). 

Strategies for growth and expansion of a nonprofit organization can help sus-
tain a company into the likely future and impact positive social change in or-
ganizations, communities, individuals, the environment, and society. The impli-
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cations for positive social change include providing growth and expansion strat-
egies leaders of nonprofit organizations can use to increase their capacity for po-
sitively altering communities by increasing accessible opportunities and services 
to individuals and organizations. 

The right working environment has a profound impact and influences em-
ployee morale. Böckerman and Ilmakunnas (2020) postulated positive working 
situations are the basis for employee job satisfaction and employee loyalty. Bla-
naru and Medeleanu (2017) asserted that employee loyalty leads to exceptional 
organizational performance. Researchers have recognized an association be-
tween employee loyalty and organizational performance. 
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