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Abstract 
The main objective of this study was to examine the role of Indigenous con-
flict resolution mechanisms in the pastoral community for social solidarity in 
Shineli Woreda, which is found in Somali regional State. A qualitative re-
search design was employed under which, Focus group discussion, 
semi-structured interview and observations were conducted and the data was 
analyzed qualitatively. A total of 60 informants were selected by using purpo-
sive sampling technique. The finding of this study revealed that, conflict in 
the pastoral community was largely caused by competition over scarce re-
sources (water and pasture land related problems), livestock raids, and re-
venge traditions. Besides, informants indicated that historical and political 
factors, drought, land alienation for investment, and idleness amongst the 
youth were the other causes of conflict in the pastoral community. Moreover, 
almost all informants of the study were used and preferred indigenous con-
flict resolution mechanisms which are deep rooted in the pastoral communi-
ty. Community elders, religious father, clan leaders are key players of indi-
genous conflict resolution mechanisms. Finally, study participants stated that 
the decision made by elders and social sanctions in the community plays a 
crucial role in managing conflict through ingenious mechanisms. 
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1. Introduction 

The history of conflict is as old as human history and conflict is inevitable phe-
nomenon [1]. Conflict is inevitable in any relationship. It will happen whether 
we like it or not. Conflict by itself is not positive or negative. However, how we 
manage the conflict can have positive or negative consequences in our relation-
ships. Conflicts erupt when a society fails to carefully handle contradictions 
through tolerance, dialogue and reciprocal accommodation of interests [2]. 

Ethiopia is a country where various ethnic groups live together. Eldership has 
been part of Ethiopian culture which runs deep into the Ethiopian history but 
there are regional variations in the traditional eldership mechanisms of conflict 
resolutions. Besides the formal system of conflict resolution, different social 
groups have distinctive traditional settings and relationships, where the indi-
genous mechanisms could play a significant role in resolving and preventing 
violent conflicts in the community and society at large [3]. 

The root causes of conflict are unfulfilled or threatened human needs, includ-
ing security, identity, dignity, recognition and justice. It is important to note that 
one great source of conflict is competition over scarce resources for survival. We 
may find ourselves in conflict when we think there are not enough resources like 
food, money, grazing land to sustain us [4]. 

Peace is the most important ingredient for smooth functioning of the com-
munity. Peace building is largely equated with the construction of a social envi-
ronment that advances a sense of confidence and improves conditions of life. As 
conflict occurs at personal, communal, social, national and global levels, the 
styles of conflict resolution/management used differ largely at these different le-
vels [5]. 

Conflicts in Ethiopia could easily be handled at the grass-root levels by the so-
cieties themselves without the direct intervention of the government. After all, 
Ethiopia is believed to be the home of more than 80 ethnic groups. They have 
their own distinct languages, and cultures. These various ethnic and cultural 
groups for so long years have developed their own unique political or adminis-
trative, economic, social and judicial systems. They had been able to sustain 
themselves without necessitating to have copied the Western modes of gover-
nance in mechanisms of conflict resolution [3]. 

Beyene [5] indicated that the high success rate of elders’ interventions in con-
flict resolution was witnessed in spite of its revealed weaknesses than other types 
of third parties such as diplomats, professional mediators, and good offices from 
international organizations like the UN. In this connection, a large study of 
mediation in international conflicts between 1945 and 1990, over half (55%) of 
the high-level mediation attempts were unsuccessful. Mediation can be deemed 
successful when it makes a considerable and positive difference to a manage-
ment of a conflict and the subsequent interaction between the parties. In con-
trast, failure is defined as occurring when mediation has no reported impact on 
the disputant parties’ behavior. However, as a society moves towards moderni-
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zation and civilization, the formal methods (modern legal systems) of conflict 
resolution become leading and the primary choice while the traditional practices 
hold secondary place in comparison to the formal court system. 

Despite their widespread utility and implication, the problem faced with indi-
genous mechanisms of conflict resolution is that, they are not documented as 
contributive to peace. It usually arises when community solidarity is lost to vio-
lent conflict that the importance of such community virtues begins to get recog-
nized. Moreover, modernity and civilization of the western world pushed to ex-
tremely fail to appreciate fully the contribution of indigenous conflict manage-
ment and peacemaking mechanisms to the maintenance of a community and 
society solidarity. More specifically, this research has attempted to answer the 
following basic research objectives: 
• Identify the perceived causes of conflict in the pastoral community. 
• Assess the features and procedures of indigenous conflict resolution in the 

community. 
• Indicate the most preferred and efficient mechanisms of conflict resolution in 

the community. 
• Examine the strengths and drawbacks of indigenous conflict resolution sys-

tems. 

2. Literature Review  
2.1. An Overview about Indigenous Conflict Resolution  

Mechanisms 

As long as people live in society or group, there are conflicts arising from differ-
ences of interests, prejudice, needs and ambitions. Therefore, the approach 
adopted to prevent or resolve such difference of interests determines its resolu-
tion. In other words, when a conflict happens, the crucial point should be the ef-
fective adoption of the necessary principle of the resolution. Indigenous me-
chanisms are grass root approaches to solve conflicts by the society [6] [7] [8]. 

The most important elements involving in this mechanism include the tradi-
tion of forgiveness, respect for elders because of their symbolic authority to en-
force decisions and transfer of resource as compensation [9] [10] [11]. 

Indigenous conflict management and resolution mechanisms use local actors 
and traditional community-based judicial and legal decision-making mechan-
isms to manage and resolve conflicts within or between communities. Local 
mechanisms aim to resolve conflicts without resorting to state-run judicial sys-
tems, police, or other external structures [9] [12] [13]. 

2.2. Strengths and Challenges of Indigenous Conflict Resolution  
Mechanisms 

Some of the advantages of indigenous conflict resolution, in contrast with the 
court litigation or formal way of conflict resolution are given as it has low cost, 
speed, accessibility, cultural relevance, and responsiveness to the poor people’s 
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concerns. According to Ethiopian Human Council [14] also revealed that indi-
genous conflict resolution is advantageous as the conflicting parties are active 
participants, raising public interest and awareness, gives rise to permanent reso-
lution of conflict as well as it employed non-discriminatory approach on its 
conduct. 

Indigenous conflict management and resolution mechanisms aim to resolve 
conflicts locally, preceding or replacing external conflict resolution and thereby 
reducing reliance on external structures. Indigenous mediation helps the com-
munity keep control over the outcome of the conflict. Implementing this ap-
proach does not require sophisticated party structures or expensive campaigns; 
it provides a low-cost, empowering means of resolving conflicts within a rela-
tively short time frame [11] [15].  

In many societies, elders have indigenous jurisdiction in facilitation, arbitra-
tion, and monitoring outcomes [1]. Indigenous conflict mediators typically pos-
sess moral status, seniority, neutrality and respect of the community; they are 
acceptable to all parties and demonstrate leadership capacity. Resolutions are 
generally accepted and respected by all concerned parties [5]. 

According to Hashim [15] indicated that some indigenous conflict resolution 
efforts may be weakened by age or gender bias for example, in cases with no 
women elders, some women may believe that male elders are biased against 
women and that this will be reflected in their decisions. Therefore, the above 
idea can imply that the indigenous authorities are predominantly not progres-
sive elements of social change. 

Indigenous conflict resolution processes will allow community members to 
pursue remedies and resolve conflicts outside of the courtroom and still within 
their own cultural confines. Practiced in Indigenous communities since time 
immemorial, they are culturally more appropriate than litigation because they 
are based on the customs and traditions of the group concerned. Litigating in 
court is normally prohibitive; with long case queues, intermittent delay in the 
resolution of motions or claims is quite common. More importantly, litigation 
with its basic rudiments of confrontation, fault-finding and judge made resolu-
tions, coupled with its adversarial nature [16]. 

Assefa [1] has summarized only some of the advantages of indigenous conflict 
resolution mechanisms as they quickly respond to crisis in terms of time, they 
contribute to the reduction of regular court case loads, they contribute to saving 
of the public money, it also minimizes the problem in shortage of judges who 
work in the regular courts, and budget constraints, they are complementary to 
modern government structures and are not substitutes or competitors as some 
government officials think and worry about, They give access to many people 
who do not find modern system of conflict resolution comfortable, affordable or 
suitable to their needs, Disputants are satisfied with their operation and view 
their outcomes as fair. 

Even though indigenous conflict resolution has its own socio-economic ad-
vantage for individuals, groups, societies and communities, it has facing many 
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challenges from different directions. The main challenges that affect indigenous 
conflict resolution method are lack of clear legal mandates, limited financial 
support from different national and international governments and limited ca-
pacity for oversight of system performance can all put in danger the effectiveness 
of the method to improve access to justice for the society [17]. 

3. Methods of the Study 
3.1. Study Area 

This study was conducted in Sitti zone, Shineli Woreda, in Somali Regional 
State. It is one of the nine zones in Somali Regional State in Ethiopia. Sitti zone 
is bordered on the south by Dire Dawa and the Oromia Region, on the west by 
the Afar Region, on the north by Djibouti, on the east by Somali land, and on the 
southeast by Jijiga city. For this study, Shineli Woreda pastoral community 
members were the study population. 

3.2. Design 

The research design for this study was a qualitative approach which aimed to 
examine the indigenous conflict resolution mechanism in the pastoral commu-
nity for social solidarity.  

The justification for using a qualitative approach is that, it provides in-depth 
and rich information on the issue under investigation. 

3.3. Participants 

The sample for this study was selected from members of the pastoral communi-
ty, under which, 60 informants were selected as sample of the study. Those in-
formants of the study were selected to conduct interview and focus group dis-
cussion (FGD) by using purposive sampling technique. This implies that only 
those individuals who are believed to give enough and relevant information in 
the pastoral community was included.  

Accordingly, informants of interview and focus group discussion (FGD) was 
selected on the criteria that they would have better accumulated knowledge and 
experiences on the issue undertaken.  

3.4. Instruments 

A mix of primary and secondary sources of data was employed. The primary 
data was collected through focus group discussion (FGD), semi-structured in-
terview and observation. The secondary sources of data were official or unoffi-
cial documents pertaining to the study undertaken. Finally, the collected data 
was analyzed though in a qualitative way. 

4. Results and Discussion 
4.1. Nature of Conflict in the Community 

Conflict is not a new phenomenon in the pastoral community. However, the 

https://doi.org/10.4236/oalib.1106122


T. K. Muluken 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/oalib.1106122 6 Open Access Library Journal 
 

nature of conflict changed from time to time at intra and inter-clan level. In the 
study area, competition for scarce resources (water and pasture land) and lives-
tock raids were issues related with the nature of conflict. However, conflicts 
happened in the community, the conflicts are solved by indigenous way. In this 
regard, Informants of the study indicated that, Somali people have a strong sense 
of respect to the legendary indigenous rules and guidelines that descended to 
them from their predecessors.  

When a breach of conflict or misbehavior is detected, reference is quickly 
made to such unwritten customary laws on the basis of the normative frame-
work and values systems entrenched in their culture from time immemorial. 
One such fundamental norm is the fear of and respect for elderly personalities in 
the respective community. Elders are believed to have the wisdom and insightful 
thought accumulated over long period of time. They are considered as instru-
mental for the transfer of traditional knowledge and custom to successive gener-
ations.  

4.2. Major Causes of Conflict in the Pastoral Community 

Informants and focus group discussants were indicated that Conflicts among the 
pastoral communities are largely caused by competition over scarce resources 
(water and pasture land), livestock raids and revenge tradition. Beyene [5] stated 
that pastoralists are facing more pressure and challenges because of the loss of 
pasture land, and water related problems. 

In addition to this, respondents were revealed that, conflicts include historical 
and political factors, drought, land alienation for investment, and idleness 
amongst the youth were the other causes of conflict in the community. The re-
sult of this study is somehow consistent with previous conducted research by [3]. 

Mesfin [10] revealed that exploitation of natural resources and other related 
environmental stresses are crucial in all phases of the conflicts, from outbreak 
and perpetuation of violence to undermining prospects for peace. He noted that 
at least 40% of the intrastate conflicts in the last sixty years are associated with 
natural resources (land and water problems).  

According to elders of the study area, even if conflicts have been raised be-
tween intra clans, they are temporal and occasional. According to the elders’ re-
sponse, conflicts between clans in the last many years were mainly for access and 
uses of resources such as farm, grazing lands, water issues and sometimes land 
alienation for project. As the data obtained from interview and focus group dis-
cussion informants, the communities were characterized by competition over 
grazing land and water resources. Resource scarcity pertaining to grazing lands 
and water resources has increased levels of violent conflict and tension between 
local communities.  

The data gained from the focus group discussion participants indicated that, 
there are different reasons for the existence of land conflict in the study area. 
From these common reasons of land conflict, many people do not have land es-
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pecially grazing land for their cattle and camel. Because of shortage of grazing 
land, many people get into conflict to protect his/her land to be taken by another 
body. Moreover, discussants also said that, inheritances, ownership of land and 
boarder conflict are mentionable causes of conflict in the community. The find-
ing is relatively competent with the previous research conducted by [11]. 

Indigenous conflict resolution system cultivates the relationship of conflicting 
parties towards the future. This conflict resolution method is necessary for the 
re-establishment of social relationship or bringing together of the society in 
general and conflicting parties in particular. Indigenous conflict resolution sys-
tem allows conflicting parties to work cooperatively by minimizing their gap in 
productive way that does not demolish their relationship [10].  

Indigenous conflict resolution mechanism can provide us procedures that can 
resolve disagreements successfully without harming relationships. In indigenous 
conflict resolution process, the conflicting parties could rather help to learn in-
formation that will permit them to work more efficiently to their future life [18]. 
Indigenous conflict resolution can provide us procedures that can resolve disa-
greements successfully without harming relationships. The method used for a 
conflict at hand can make available a frame work to deal with predictable con-
flicts [19].  

The data gained from focus group discussion participants revealed that local 
elders have playing great role in providing advice for the community to minim-
ize local conflicts. One key Interviewee participants also said that we are always 
advice the conflicting parties to solve their conflict through local elders. Because 
the decision passed by court or formal conflict resolution systems is not good for 
social relationship rather it leads revenge in the community.  

4.3. The Role of Indigenous Conflict Resolution Mechanisms in the  
Community 

Pastoral communities have two conflict resolution options: the formal (modern) 
and informal (indigenous) systems. The modern system of conflict resolution is 
conducted in court through litigation with strict procedures. However, the in-
formants of the study revealed that, when compared with modern institutions, 
the indigenous systems for prevention and resolution of conflict less complex, 
save time and money. In this connection, [3] asserted that indigenous conflict 
resolutions are time-tested and effective in handling conflict. 

4.4. Preferences of the Community towards Indigenous Conflict  
Resolution  

The conflict resolutions in the pastoral community by local elders and mediators 
may take the form of negotiation or arbitration and generally reached an agree-
ment with reference to Somali people norms, values and traditions. 

Informants clearly stated that, indigenous conflict resolution are widely used 
and popular in the pastoral community and have different advantages, including 
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responding quickly to crisis, contributing to reduction of regular court case load, 
contributing to save public money or resources. Indigenous conflict resolution 
mechanisms give access to many people who do not find the modern system of 
conflict resolution comfortable, affordable, or suited to their needs, satisfy dis-
putants with their operation and their outcomes are seen as fair. This is because 
these mechanisms give a chance to the parties to actively participate in handling 
their affairs compared to the modern legal system. 

Tigist [9] asserted that traditional conflict resolution mechanisms are very 
helpful as they allow the community to handle their problems in their own way. 
She also added that, unlike the modern ones, indigenous conflict resolution me-
chanisms focus on reconciling feuding parties rather than punishing. In addi-
tion, Social sanctions are the central law enforcement mechanisms of indigenous 
conflict resolution. 

Such mechanisms give emphasis for longstanding and cross cutting ties 
among community members while the modern legal system work according to 
fixed code of law and marked by corruption. As compared to modern systems of 
conflict resolution, traditional mechanisms of prevention and resolution of con-
flicts are less complex, more time saving, and give chance to parties in conflict to 
actively participate in solving their own problems, and handling their own affairs 
by their own way. On top of these, FGDs and interview participants clearly 
stated that the pastoral community chooses indigenous conflict resolution me-
chanisms as compared to the legal systems (court) for conflict arising at any level 
in the study area. 

According to informants, going to court bears grudge, because the outcome is 
definitely win-lose, which spoils future social interaction in one hand. Large in-
vestment of time and money to finish the conflict cases in court result in redun-
dant appointment that is made for further investigation, and marked by corrup-
tion.  

4.5. Procedures of Indigenous Conflict Resolution Mechanism in  
the Community 

In the pastoral community, there are indigenous conflicts management institu-
tions that have existed for long periods of time and remain effective. The proce-
dures for managing these conflicts are vital in preventing chronic violence. Al-
most all discussants and interview participants were explained that, 90 per cent 
of disputes are resolved on the first try with indigenous conflict resolution me-
chanisms. And the remaining 10 per cent are resolved through the state inter-
vention although sometimes the conflict cases turn back to elders through indi-
genous conflict resolution. The result of this study relatively is consistent with 
previous study conducted by [1]. 

The institutions that elders developed are generally respected because elders 
are seen as trustworthy and knowledgeable people in the community and are be-
lieved to make rational decisions. The unwritten Xeer-customary law of the so-

https://doi.org/10.4236/oalib.1106122


T. K. Muluken 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/oalib.1106122 9 Open Access Library Journal 
 

ciety is exercised by the well-experienced elders who transfer the informal rules, 
values and traditions from one generation to another. The elders play the role of 
mediating, arbitrating, managing and resolving the conflict in the community 
[10]. 

According to informants, the process of indigenous conflict resolution based 
on consultation and open discussion between the disputant parties. Mediation is 
carried out by a person of high social standing, commonly elders, religious fa-
thers, clan leaders who use their social legitimacy and facilitative skill. In accor-
dance with Somali custom, elders are the key actors in the process of conflict 
resolution. 

Discussants of FGDs were stated that, In the event of any violent conflict, 
there are steps followed in the resolution process. In its initial intervention, eld-
ers’ council consisting of 10 to 12 members advises the conflicting parties just to 
cool down their temper and conflict. After listening to conflicting parties, the 
council of elders invites one of their members to repeat the main causes of the 
conflict. These steps lead to the final decision on the case in which the council 
requests the conflicting parties to leave the place for some time in order to judge 
the evidence gathered secretly and finally disclose the decision. If the accused 
group accepts the decision given by elders, the conflict will be settled. But, if he 
does not accept it, he can appeal up to 12 times for the case to be reconsidered.  

Interview participants indicated that offence against another member of the 
community is usually resolved upon the payment of compensation both in li-
vestock and cash. In this regard, an entire clan or sub-clan is said to be responsi-
ble for acrime committed by one or some of its members. The money and lives-
tock to be paid in compensation is thus usually contributed by clan members 
regardless of their place of residence. For instance, if a man from a particular 
clan kills a member of the other clan, it is not an individual that defends his case, 
rather, it is any other two members of his clan that would appear at the indi-
genous conflict resolution system.  

Moreover, amount of blood money for the compensation will be decided (100 
cattle for unintentional killing and 150 cattle for intentional killing). Out of 100 
cattlels, the family of the deceased will have 15 and the remaining 85 will be 
shared among other members of the clan. Informants also said that, different 
numbers of cattels are given for blood money compensation for different injuries 
depending on its severity. Besides, to recover and maintain smooth relationship 
between the two actors of the conflict, the injured is taken by the family of the 
injurer to take care of him by feeding, attending to him until his recovery.  

4.6. Actors of Indigenous Conflict Resolution Mechanisms in the  
Community 

Informants indicated that, Conflict in has been resolved through different tradi-
tional conflict resolution mechanisms. In the study area, community elders, reli-
gious father, clan leader are key players of indigenous conflict resolution in the 
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community. 
Furthermore, focus group discussant stated that, sometimes the role that 

women play within the customary systems in resolving conflict and sustaining 
peace were mentionable. In this connection, there is a saying “women are consi-
dered as ambassador in resolving inter-clan conflict in the community”. 

4.7. Strength and Challenges of Indigenous Conflict Resolution  
Mechanisms 

Respondents indicated that Indigenous mechanism of conflict resolution con-
sumes lower cost and the process takes greater speed, the reason for this is solv-
ing conflicts through this mechanism normally requires the permission, and 
commitment of the parties involved in the process. Implementing this approach 
does not require sophisticated party structures or expensive campaigns; it pro-
vides a low-cost and empowering means of resolving conflicts within a relatively 
short time frame. The process is less challenging than formal conflict resolution 
system and so reduces the likely hood of win or loss mentality and provides a 
frame work for the future dispute between the parties. As opposed to formal 
conflict resolution system, indigenous conflict resolution process is faster, 
cheaper and less formalized in the process of resolution [20].  

Informants said that, the most common complaint about formal conflict res-
olution systems or courts is the prolonged nature of their procedures and the 
associated belief that taking a very long period of time. In addition, to hear the 
case over a number of sessions and to bring witnesses or other evidence were 
mentionable in related with the court system. 

The data obtained from focus group discussion and interview also assured 
that using indigenous conflict resolution mechanism has many advantages in 
relation with saving of money and time. It takes short period of time to solve 
conflicts and disputants can solve their conflict in their local area. It decreases 
the cost and time involved in solving conflict like material cost, transportation 
cost, time and other costs. But using formal or court system takes a very long pe-
riod of time to solve a single case and leads to economic crises like; court charge, 
filling cost, and expenditure for lawyers, and other costs. Therefore, indigenous 
conflict resolution system is more advantageous or merit full in terms of saving 
money and time. 

The challenges of indigenous conflict resolution method are lack of clear legal 
mandates, limited financial support from different national and international 
governments and limited capacity for oversight of system performance can all 
put in danger the effectiveness of the method to improve access to justice for the 
society, specially these issues are visible in developing countries [21]. 

The focus group participants said that sometimes the government provides 
training but when the government tried to give training for local elders, the 
process of selecting the participants was unfair. The Kebelle administrator selects 
his close friends and others who have kinship with him sent to the training area 
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due to political manipulation. This situation created that locally accepted leaders 
could not develop their capacity.  

The other challenge raised by group discussion participants was sometimes 
the decision of local elders does not accept as a binding rule by the government. 
This means after decision passed by local elders on conflict parties, the govern-
ment continued to punish the disputants by neglecting the decision of the elders.  

Therefore, the result indicated that the government does not provide the right 
support to consolidate indigenous conflict resolution mechanism with the for-
mal court system in the community.  

5. Summary and Conclusions  
5.1. Summary  

The major goal of this study was to examine the role of indigenous conflict res-
olution mechanisms in the pastoral community for social solidarity in Somali 
region, Shineli Woreda. To achieve this study, a qualitative research design was 
employed to explore the role of indigenous conflicts resolution mechanism in 
the community and its implication for social solidarity.  

The data were collected through interview, focus group discussion, and ob-
servation. A total of 60 informants were selected purposefully for this study. The 
finding results revealed that competition over natural resources (pasture land 
and water related problems), livestock raids and revenge traditions were the 
main cause of conflict in the pastoral community.  

Elders, religious fathers and clan leaders were the key players of indigenous 
conflict resolution mechanisms. Furthermore, the pastoral communities pre-
ferred indigenous conflict resolution than modern system (courts) due to the 
various reasons: First, it is flexible as compared to formal legal systems that are 
perceived as full of strict procedures. Second, it plays a fundamental role to 
maintain social harmony and solidarity in the pastoral communities. 

5.2. Conclusions  

Majority of the informants indicated that competition over scarce resources 
(water and pasture land related issues), livestock raids and revenge traditions 
were the main cause of conflict in the community. Besides, informants also re-
vealed that historical and political factors, drought, land alienation for invest-
ment, and idleness amongst the youth were the other causes of conflict in the 
pastoral community.  

Informants were indicated that conflict resolution via local conflict mediators 
is preferable than using formal system or court system in the study area. There 
are different reasons that forced the residents to use indigenous conflict resolu-
tion mechanism. First, the costs of indigenous conflict resolution system like 
material cost, transportation cost, time and other costs are low. Second, the 
process of indigenous conflict resolution system takes greater speed.  

Finally, indigenous conflict resolution system is very important means of con-
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flict resolution by increasing social harmony, addressing common problems of 
the community and increasing support of each other and tolerance. In order to 
promote sustainable peace in the pastoral community, indigenous conflict reso-
lution mechanisms should be integrated and work jointly with the modern sys-
tems of conflict resolution. 

5.3. Recommendations 

Based on the result, the following recommendations were made and forwarded: 
• It would be better if the government gives due attention to the values and so-

cial assets of indigenous conflict resolution mechanisms like the modern legal 
system.  

• It would be better if the government provides training on indigenous conflict 
management system in the community. 

• Initiate indigenous conflict handling strategies and formulate structures for 
policy implementation. 

• It would be better if the media support indigenous conflict resolution me-
chanism for peace building strategies. 
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