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Abstract 
It has been a fact that sustainability and employee turnover in corporations 
rely heavily on the different styles of management practiced at given compa-
nies nowadays. This paper addresses both theories X and Y of Mc Gregor in 
economic crisis, where X is the one that might get the poor results focusing 
on instrumental, physiological values comparing to theory Y where managers 
are effective leaders with better performance and terminal values promoting 
self-esteem and actualities. The purpose of this paper is to analyze both theo-
ries and determine the effective way to reach the ultimate results. Mc Gregor’s 
philosophy insists on two fundamental approaches to manage people while 
combining additional factors other than human nature such as the human 
relations can play a positive role for effective change. This paper combines a 
realistic management style to the traditional known autocratic (X) and dem-
ocratic (Y) styles during economic crisis. Theory X and Y are two different 
management styles with certain philosophy interpreted by each style manag-
er. They both look at ways and means on how to motivate employees and 
therefore have a feel of characters of their workers. Each theory tackles its 
philosophy from its end, for example, theory X believes pushing employees to 
work by having punishment and rewards can actually be a motivational fac-
tor, while theory Y promotes the self-management, self-esteem, management 
by objective leading to intrinsic and extrinsic rewards. 
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1. Theory X 

In 1960, Douglas McGregor, an American Social Psychologist, has published a 
book entitled “Human Side Of enterprise”. This book describes the development 
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of two new theories X and Y. Both of them refer to a new style of management 
and human motivation.  

Theory X is an autocratic management style where the manager has the cen-
tralization of power and takes decision without taking the opinion of colleagues 
at work. It reflects on the personality of the manager which reveals on the out-
side a confident image and well hands-on managed business.  

McGregor believed that theory X stresses on the satisfaction of the lower 
needs where extrinsic rewards are on pay and benefits. McGregor believes that 
people by nature dislike and avoid work. Accordingly, they should be forced, 
monitored, controlled and directed either by punishment or rewards to keep 
them working (McGregor, 1960). 

Theory X has a fanatical, narrow minded, poor listener, short tempered, arro-
gant style of management and has no interest in the human issues in general. It 
assumes that people by nature are not willing to do their jobs and that their as-
signed duties are not done because they always find ways not to finish them. 
They have no confidence and are not trusted by the organization. The environ-
ment is described by all means on how to deal with pessimistic and lazy people 
while finding ways to comprehend with the management style. As per the theory 
X, a successful company has better productivity attained when the management 
staff forces the employees to finish their duties at work. A strict control and be-
havior monitoring are performed on the workers in order to avoid slacking to-
wards the task at hand. Motivation is achieved only through punishment, threats, 
fear and special rewards. 

A management can be “hard” or “strong” (The Human Side of Enterprise). 
The manager should have close supervision and direct control over the em-
ployees’ behaviors. McGregor believed that when a person has shelter and food, 
it means that his physiological needs are satisfied which extends from birth to 
death (The Human Side of Enterprise). Once physiological needs are satisfied, 
man moves to safety where protection against danger harm, which leads to secu-
rity, should be present. People do not like to be responsible; they only want se-
curity and a little ambition. 

In this theory, people are only interested in both physiological and safety 
needs rather than higher needs. Due to the business globalization, such as stan-
dards of living, education level, political nature affected possibilities and restric-
tions of organizational behavior, several factors have changed career paths, job 
securities and job satisfactions.  

During the 90s, workers used to be afraid to lose their jobs since it was harder 
to find a new job than it had been twenty years ago. Several companies reduced 
their workforces which made employees wonder about the companies’ loyalty 
towards them since these organizations had dropped their loyalty at first (Camp, 
1994; Ciulla, 2000). It made employees accept lower salaries within stable jobs 
and lower risks, rather than choosing higher salaries with greater risks (Hart, 
1998). This had an outcome whereby managers could not link the individual 
needs to the needs of the organization since the workers did not feel that the or-
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ganization is loyal towards them. Also, people were dissatisfied with their jobs. 
This dissatisfaction was high amongst minorities and women (Schmidt, 1999) 
affected by gender, permanent status, position and salary. 

Theory X persists not due to the nature of jobs, but because different people 
have personalities that respond more to this theory. Management is not giving 
orders to employees where the needs of the organization and the needs of the 
employees are balanced. The strength of theory X helps managers understand 
the thoughts that focus on how employees relate to work (Kirton, 1976). 

In Theory X, centralization of power leads employees to dissatisfaction, as it 
also forces them to please the manager. The manager has no interest in the hu-
man issues, and makes people work under pressure. 

The employees have no ambition and avoid responsibilities. They have no 
confidence and are not trustworthy. Theory X has a direct effect on the organi-
zation structure where salaries are paid based on the position of the employee 
rather than personal qualifications. The employee is always to be blamed without 
checking if the problem is from the system, policy or lack of training. Here the 
manager stresses on the punishment or reward of the employees in order to 
make them work. 

2. Theory Y 

As for the Theory Y, the distribution of mental effort at work is expected rather 
needed. The commitment is considered one of the important behaviors related 
directly to the individual’s achievement. The employee of this environment will 
be characterized by the responsibility towards the company and the tasks given 
that show high level of creativity to solve the problems facing the organization. 

Beside employees’ major role described by Theory Y, Managers’ role is equally 
important specially that their role changed from being autocratic in Theory X to 
a more democratic leadership style. In fact, Y Managers consider people com-
mitted to work and responsible to find solutions. They are totally convinced that 
their employees do not only accept responsibilities, but they seek for it. These 
managers are more participative and interact better with all the team members 
therefore delegate more responsibilities. They believe in teamwork and that their 
employees have high degrees of imagination and creativity to identify problems 
and end up with the right solutions. 

As for Theory Y, the best way to manage people is to manage as little as possi-
ble (Stewart, 2010). A Y manager will help others to be successful in order to 
succeed. Managers should be aware that business is all about people, so if we 
trust people, they will trust us back and they will be more productive. In fact, 
most of the people nowadays are Y people especially when it comes to motiva-
tional tasks. 

As per McGregor, people beliefs will have a direct impact on their behavior 
inside the work. Managers should support higher levels of mind freedom and 
responsibilities to improve and increase productivity. They should start to be-
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lieve and act as one of the team by adopting less autocratic type of management. 
All decisions should be shared and negotiated by the team in order to have the 
best decision. By promoting creativity and delegating more responsibilities to 
employees, the company effectively will achieve its goals and perform at best. 

Recent studies revealed that Theory Y is most and better adapted for organ-
izations that need problem solving and individual participation in decision 
making, so it fits more the environment where creativity, problem solving, and 
scientific issues exist. A good environment for theory Y to be implemented is in 
technology industries and internet companies where managers have shown high 
levels of flexibility and understanding allowing employees to accomplish their 
work from home. Moreover, employees have shown their satisfaction even if 
they consider that they are less paid and they do not have enough vacations 
(Morse and Lorsch, 1970). 

Before the distribution of work, companies must decide about how to deal 
with the employees. Usually, this relation is defined by the related terms and 
conditions that should be implemented. The beliefs held by the employee to-
wards these internal regulations are known as the psychological contract (Ro-
binson et al., 1994). More specifically, it is what the employee expects from the 
organization and vice versa in terms of inputs and outcomes.  

Theory Y managers have better results in leading people to grow and develop. 
According to McGregor “Man is a waiting animal and as soon as one of his 
needs is satisfied, another appears in its place”. By adopting the Theory Y man-
agement style, people will be more productive, responsible, motivated, and 
higher levels of self-esteem will be achieved. Theory Y managers give employees 
ways to solve and improve work. It is a democratic style of management allow-
ing people to be part of the decisions. Therefore, managers of the Theory Y are 
liberal managers that influence people and believe in them for a better organiza-
tion. Given all the characteristics above, psychological contract fulfillment is 
more related to Theory Y than Theory X. Thus, theory Y offers a new aspect of 
management that gives more attention to the human side (Bobic, 2003). 

Although theory Y presents the democratic management, there are some main 
issues of concerns. For instance, McGregor in Theory Y assumes that all people 
are creative or at least want to be creative but the issue is that people have dif-
ferent personalities that respond to theory X more than theory Y in some cases. 

3. Physiological and Self-Actualization 

Records show that in the past, employees had a long path career under one or 
two employers. In the late nineties, workers were facing different environment 
since they were expected to work for six to seven employers in their careers 
(Hart, 1998). Employees in the majority cases were no longer loyal to one place 
and they believed in return that their employers have less loyalty to them (Camp, 
1994; Ciulla, 2000). The reason why employees became less loyal to their com-
panies because of job security especially after 1996 when AT & T fired more than 
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five hundred employees and other companies did the same. American workers 
felt the lack of job security. As a result, people started to search for jobs with 
higher levels of security superseding ideal jobs with terminal values and satisfac-
tion. This brings the fact that job seekers may choose theory X management with 
better job security over Y especially when working environment and economic con-
ditions are uncertain and less stable compared to 1950s and 1960s (Walesh, 1997). 

This brings us to today’s economic crisis where employees are struggling to 
find jobs to fit best their skills and knowledge. On the other hand, employers al-
so are having difficulties in filling out positions. Before the 2019 crisis, technol-
ogy and innovation were the agents of change and improvement with a lot of 
opportunities in the labor market. Millions of employees’ today are faced with 
lay-offs and unknown destiny when it comes to keeping their jobs or employ-
ment seeking (Orrell et al., 2020). 

Decision-makers and officials need to have the flexibility to help job seekers 
during economic crisis with financial resources to meet their needs and perform 
their potential jobs by acquiring training that fits their needs, with additional 
resources on services such as internet, transportation, childcare that basically 
ease the process of going to work and be ready for the new employment (Orrell 
et al., 2020). 

In addition to job security that assures an income through a job, the United 
Nations identified other human securities that can be possibly linked to job se-
curity such as food security which is on one end the access to food, economically 
speaking which can be vital to the wellbeing of employees that affects tremend-
ously their performance. Health security is another human security concern 
mentioned as well, by having a job security, the employee would have access to 
health care and many other benefits. Human security has to be provided to 
people and employees not only to secure the basic needs of Maslow’s hierarchy 
model but also to add to that political stability, environmental security and also 
community security, a sense of belonging to share common interest and beha-
viors (Hamourtziadou, 2019). 

Although Mc Gregor fundamentally altered the course of management theory 
years ago, three core elements of his theory have undergone significant erosion 
(Bobic, 2003). 

Firstly, many employees today find themselves in a situation that inspires 
neither satisfaction nor job fidelity. Secondly, Maslow’s hierarchy of needs 
theory has some critics. Lastly, studies on human motivation no longer define 
“creativity” plainly as “innovation”. 

Employees, in the past, expected long careers subsequent to a given career 
path under one or two employers. However, before the economic crisis em-
ployees faced essentially different environment. In a Shell Corporation survey, 
more than 52 percent of the 1100 surveyed workers expected to hold five or 
more jobs in their careers. Moreover, workers engage in a “constant” search for 
new employments, regardless if they are satisfied in their current jobs. This un-
doubtedly contrasts with Mc Gregor hypothesis that career would exist largely 
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within the same organization. Sixty-five percent of the Shell corporation sur-
veyed workers were “only slightly” loyal or “not too loyal” to their employers. 
Moreover, 75 percent of the respondents claimed that companies were either 
“somewhat loyal” or “not loyal at all” to them (Hart, 1998). 

Maslow’s hierarchy has been subject of debate with plentiful critics challeng-
ing its theoretical and empirical foundations (Heylighen, 1992, Rowan, 1998). 

Researchers have pointed out that Maslow did not succeed in considering key 
essentials of human motivation (Bobic, 2003). Moreover, Rowan (1998) feared 
that the hierarchy’s unprincipled structure would lead to ignore ethical and po-
litical considerations other than the self. Most critics also point to the funda-
mentally western and specifically American bias originated in Maslow’s percep-
tion of self-actualization (Bobic, 2003). 

Most of the common criticisms of Maslow’s hierarchy are that the model has 
never been validated empirically (Bobic, 2003). Heylighen (1992) disputed that 
Maslow’s concept of self-actualization was confusing and that a theory based on 
the satisfaction of needs was not enough to explicate human behavior. 

4. Findings and Analysis 

Workers’ career paths, workers’ job security, workers’ job satisfaction, and the 
degree to which worker’s prefer security over creativity are four aspects of work 
environment that have been dramatically distorted during the latest economic 
crisis. A survey was conducted in Lebanon in the last quarter of 2020 showed 
that employees are no longer looking to switch jobs because of the external fac-
tor. Almost 42 percent were satisfied in their jobs knowing that they were getting 
a pay cut or delayed partial payments due to the current crisis. 

The study also showed that employees are putting more efforts to sustain the 
business, and this fact created a bond that was not there prior to the economic 
crisis. Employees revealed far less security in their prediction for sustained em-
ployment at any given organization than they did in the past. In this study, em-
ployees are more afraid of job loss and are less confident about the likelihood of 
finding new employment than they had been prior to the economic crisis. Em-
ployees preferred job security to “finding the ideal job” by a margin of three to 
one. In the same context, 56 percent of the surveyed employees chose the stable 
job with fewer monetary rewards and few risks over a job with greater financial 
success but with greater risk. 

This study also demonstrates that when there is an external factor such as 
economic crisis, the human expectation in terms of satisfaction and expectation 
changes drastically. Employees satisfaction even on the psychological needs be-
comes less significant although once basic needs are met, it is of human nature 
to aim for esteem needs and self-actualization.  

4.1. Effective Change 

Things have changed and most managers today are well exposed to all sorts of 
training, education of how different style of management can affect the corpo-
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rate performance of their firm yet the presence of both micro and macro man-
agers exist and this is part of the human nature. The other part is the human re-
lations which usually plays an important role in the advancement of the organi-
zations. The combination of both human nature, human relations and how well 
controllable they can be are the key constitutional of whether an effective posi-
tive change in companies is obtainable. 

For instance, if conflicts among people exist due to misunderstanding based 
on some false assumptions, the eliminations of such assumptions will develop 
the state of peace therefore a positive change happens. In case the assumptions 
are true thus there is that case real variation of interest therefore the solution 
depends on the system of their relations at first followed by their attitudes to-
wards each other (Stewart, 2010). 

Most people are averse to change because they feel they need to do more work 
that they were not supposed to do. For an effective change, employees must rec-
ognized what is it for them, for their benefit to change and how this will affect 
their sustainability as an organization in the future. Answers to questions like 
what does the organization do best in the eyes of customers; what are the exter-
nal factors that threaten the way the organization conducts business; what are 
the elements needed to have the organizations get back to its core valued prod-
ucts and services? Once employees share their ideas and ideas become coherent 
than an effective change could happen (O’Neil, 2018). 

An effective change can be implemented in both theories X and Y. The effec-
tive change is to get things done the fastest possible way without wasting any 
non-value added time yet perform the quality and requirement needed for the 
job from the resources including human available to the manager. For instance, 
in case where employees like to be directed (X type) then the manager should 
push to keep them motivated and make appropriate decisions since the authority 
is assumed unquestionable. 

On the other end if the employees are self-motivated and self-challenged (Y 
type) therefore the manager should delegate more responsibilities, give more 
challenging assignments, let the employees seek, plan, organize their own tasks 
to accomplish the assignments given with minimal yet accurate supervision 
(Geber, 1987). 

An effective modern tool which has been evolving is the use of the Enterprise 
Resource Planning (ERP) in most companies today by both style managers. Re-
gardless of whether there is an X type or a Y type manager the use of ERP can 
advance and have an effective change. For instance, in a Y environment type, 
employees may have access different screens relating to their job and can place 
orders based on the analysis of inputs and things would flow smoothly. The case 
where employees are trusted fully to perform their jobs and select the best op-
tions for the company. 

On the other end (X type), employees through the use of ERP have limited 
screens access and must go back to their supervisors for confirmation prior to 
placing an order, an additional built-in and customized screen allowing the 

https://doi.org/10.4236/jhrss.2021.91002


J. Touma 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/jhrss.2021.91002 27 Journal of Human Resource and Sustainability Studies 
 

manager to check the order prior to placing it on the system. The case where the 
employees are less trusted and performing certain tasks might require additional 
time from the micro manager. 

Even small companies today can afford the implementation of Postmodern 
ERP which is a solution on clouds, very affordable, proportional to the amount 
of users that actually use the system. Postmodern ERP can add modules and au-
tomates businesses and operational capabilities with customized screens and ap-
proval based on the management requirement within any given company. 

Adding to above, the implementation of Enterprise Risk Management (ERM) 
which is a tool to manage risks of a firm in a holistic way especially if there have 
been some negative decisions implementing change in the organization. Top 
managers with good reputation that delivers poor performance in the beginning 
must incorporate this tool that can tackle as well top management retention in 
an organization, part of managing effective change (Altuntas et al., 2020). 

In addition to technology, culture and personality of employees, an important 
measure that plays a role in what sort of style is more applicable and can score 
greater effectiveness is the situation. For instance, if working on a particular 
project, a new concept, an employee might prefer a close supervision to align the 
needs and the details required for such execution. On the other end, that same 
employee during the working career might prefer less supervision and more de-
pendency on his work leading to acknowledged performances (Caruth & Han-
dlogten, 1998). 

Another factor is exposure, managers have to be exposed to different cultures 
to absorb the employees’ differences thus its essential for managers to have in-
ternational exposure and integrate with different cultures, for instance study 
shows that when managers are exposed internationally, they tend to have a posi-
tive effect on the organization. International experience has a great impact on 
strategic change and firm performance (Le & Kroll, 2017). 

4.2. Proposed Model 

Based on the results of this study, the following model (Figure 1 below) is pro-
posed to be implemented in any given company during economic crisis and 
would potentially work certainly for companies that have similar situation when 
it comes to using the mixed approach of theory X and Y, the right combination 
of both. 

The model addresses the fact in case of economic crisis with challenging de-
mands when it comes to employment and retaining the right employees, the fol-
lowing steps are proposed: 

Step 1: Consider the mixed approach of both theories X and Y to reach 
smooth and efficient operations. 

Step 2: Integrate systems such as ERP or Postmodern ERP with the option of 
screen approval customization to minimize non-value added tasks and use re-
sources more adequately. 
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Figure 1. Proposed model for effective change.  

 
Step 3: Re-balance work tasks and allocate resources to maximize operations 

performance at the same time empower supervisors to apply the new practices 
during economic crisis. 

5. Conclusion 

The existence of X and Y theories throughout all organizations has been revolv-
ing to the degree that the choice of management style should reflect on the dif-
ferent assignments which require a mixed style approach in several cases de-
pending on the situation, flexibility with employees being managed in economic 
crisis, personalities of workers, previous styles exposed and accustomed to, em-
ployer’s inclination toward a certain style where adaptation can happen ulti-
mately and in progression. Determining the most effective method for reaching 
the organizational goals and objectives is the key element for effective positive 
change which should be blended to employees’ satisfaction and motivation in 
order to sustain efficient yet effective and rewarding business through the use of 
system integration in such economic crisis. 

Limitation 

This paper addressed the human resource and its effective change when it comes 
to economic crisis. A limiting factor of approaching employees during crisis had 
a common excuse that they were overwhelmed with a lot to do in terms of 
sourcing materials, preparation and customer support because of the economic 
crisis. 
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