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Abstract 
The purpose of this work is to highlight the distinctiveness of positive psy-
chology parenting from positive discipline and positive parenting. A second 
purpose is to frame a positive psychology parenting model adopting the prin-
ciples proposed by Seligman. The parenting research within the positive psy-
chology approach has been rather inactive. This inactivity could possibly be 
attributed to the parallel use of the term “positive” concurrently by two addi-
tional theoretical frameworks apart from positive psychology, i.e. positive dis-
cipline and positive parenting. However, in the case of positive discipline and 
positive parenting, the term “positive” describes a non-punitive, “firm and 
kind” parenting style. In the case of Positive Psychology, the term positive re-
fers to the broadening and building effect of positive emotions described by 
Fredrickson. Additionally, the target population of the positive discipline and 
positive parenting is mainly (but not exclusively) children of special chal-
lenges. Finally, their purpose is mainly prevention and treatment. The target 
population of positive psychology parenting is normally adjusted children and 
the purpose is well-being and flourishing of the child and family. These three 
elements—meaning of the term “positive”, target population and purpose— 
differentiate positive discipline and positive parenting from the Positive Psy-
chology parenting model proposed by Seligman. The differences are equiva-
lent to the different approach of “psychology as usual” from positive psychology. 
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1. Introduction 

Every single day, about one million adults become parents for first time (Bornstein 
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& Cheah, 2006). Although most people learn to parent intuitively, with almost 
no information on child development (Durrant, 2011; Papoušek & Papoušek, 
2002), parenthood has been extensively studied in empirical literature (Bornstein 
& Bornstein, 2007), and it is generally accepted that parenting decisively affects 
child’s psychological adjustment (Dwairy & Dor, 2009; Repetti, Taylor, & See-
man, 2002; Griffin, Botvin, Scheier, Diaz, & Miller, 2000; Rasmussen, 2009; 
Briesmeister & Schaefer, 2007) and well-being across lifespan (Moore & Keyes, 
2003; Pollard & Rosenberg, 2003). 

The basic concept used is this work which is described next. 
A Parent is a significant other with whom a child has a long-term, unique and 

irreplaceable emotional bond (Rohner, Khaleque, & Cournoyer, 2012). Within 
the attachment theory framework parents are attachment figures (Bowlby, 1969). 

A family is a system of people in interactivity with a similar proposition 
(Conoley & Conoley, 2009; Conoley, Conoley, & Pontrelli, 2014). In turn, a 
group of people interacting with a similar proposition is a human open system 
(von Bertalanffy, 1976). Family systems are based on the General Systems 
Theory (von Bertalanffy, 1976) suggesting families are better understood when 
studied holistically taking into account member interactions and environmental 
influences (Whiteman et al., 2011). 

Parenting involves behavior patterns across life-span, among organisms who 
belong to different generations and they are conspecifics (Lerner, Rothbaum, 
Boulos, & Castellino, 2002). More specifically, parenting is considered to be a 
complex biological and social process (Tobach & Schneirla, 1968), stretching 
beyond the provision of food and safety provided by parents to offspring. Con-
sequently, parenting is a lifespan bidirectional process between members of at 
least two generations, involving other educational, economic, political, and so-
cial institutions within a specific cultural context (Ford & Lerner, 1992; Lerner, 
Rothbaum, Boulos, & Castellino, 2002), or in other words a developmental niche 
(Super & Harkness, 1986, 1997; Harkness & Super, 2002). Parenting, parent-
hood, and child-raising are used interchangeably in this work. 

The purpose of the present study is: a) to highlight the differences between 
positive parenting and positive discipline from Positive Psychology Parenting, 
and b) to describe a model of Positive Psychology Parenting adopting the pa-
renting principles proposed by Seligman (2002). 

2. Parenting Effectiveness Criteria 

The relationship between parent and child in the light of the systemic view 
(General Systems Theory, von Bertalanffy, 1976) in developmental psychology 
(Bronfenbrenner, 1977; Super & Harkness, 1997; Bornstein, 2002; Lerner, Roth-
baum, Boulos, & Castellino, 2002) is considered to have bidirectionality (Ho-
dapp & Ly, 2005). Specifically, not only the parental behavior but also the par-
ent-child interaction within the open family—and community—system affect 
child development (Trommsdorff, 2006). Within this bidirectional framework, 
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parental goals and the child temperament were also added (Kuczynski, 2003, 
cited in Trommsdorff, 2006) as mediating variables in the parent-child relation-
ship quality (Trommsdorff, 2006). Furthermore, the disproportionate effect of 
parenting quality on children with a “difficult character” as compared to the av-
erage child was termed differential susceptibility (Pluess & Belsky, 2010). In oth-
er words, children’s development is a compound outcome of the interaction be-
tween the characteristics of the children and the ones of the parents or all signif-
icant others affecting their socialization (Mussen et al., 1990). The positive psy-
chological adjustment of the child is a measure of parenting effectiveness (Belsky, 
2015; Teti & Candelaria, 2002, cited in Bornstein & Bornstein, 2007). Parenting 
effectiveness is described as a set of parental actions that help the child adjust to 
the environment and successfully utilize opportunities offered (Saegert & Win-
kel, 1990, cited in Bradley, 2002). On the other hand, what is considered as a 
positive parental outcome varies depending on the historical period and the cul-
ture (Bradley, 2002). Nevertheless, in the western world, a successfully developed 
child could generally be described as cooperative, friendly, emotionally stable, 
reliable, having the potential to be a good, highly educated citizen (Maccoby, 
1992). Bradley and Caldwell (1995; Bradley, 2002) proposed a theoretical frame-
work to describe the tasks that parents are required to perform so as to ensure 
healthy development: 1) sustenance, 2) stimulation, 3) support, 4) structure, and 
5) surveillance. The first three tasks are based on what was defined as basic needs 
in Maslow’s Hierarchy of needs (1975; Masters and Masters & Murphy 1954, as 
commented by Bradley, 2002) as well as on a similar approach by Ford & Lerner 
(1992). The last two functions are complementary to the first three to contin-
gently fit child’s needs (Bradley, 2002). Additionally, positive parenting out-
comes have been generally related to the following parental practices: basic care, 
safety, positive emotional support (especially warmth), motivation, consistency 
and predictability, guidance, and structure (Hurley, Chiodo, Leschied, & White-
head, 2003; Rasmussen, 2009). 

A plethora of empirical evidence highlights parenting practices that generally 
boost child’s well-being at different developmental phases as follows (summa-
rized by Belsky, 2015). During infancy, sensitive and responsive parenting (pa-
rental sensitivity, De Wolff & van Ijzendoorn, 1997; Goldsmith & Alansky, 1987) 
has been reported to build attachment security (De Wolff & van Ijzendoorn, 
1997), child cooperativeness, compliance and moral development (Kochanska et 
al., 2005). Later, from preschool years to adolescence, authoritative (as opposed 
to neglectful) parenting (Baumrind, 1967), that is essentially a combination of 
warmth and firm control with consistent and clear rules, promotes prosocial 
behaviors, resilience, academic achievement and successful socialization (Ack-
erman et al., 2004). In adolescence, safeguarding autonomy and individuality 
contributes to the formulation of psychological and behavioral developmental 
“outcomes” valued in the western world (Belsky, 2015; Rasmussen, 2009). 

Particularly, warm and responsive parenting is associated with cognitive de-
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velopment (Bakeman & Brown, 1980; Bee et al., 1982; Lyons-Ruth, Connell, Zoll, 
& Stahl, 1989), as well as language development (Bee et al., 1982; Clarke-Stewart, 
1973), school attainment (Werner & Smith, 1982), and better psychological ad-
justment (Maccoby & Martin, 1983; Pettit & Bates, 1989). Additionally, warm 
and affectionate parenting has also been described as sensitive parenting (De 
Wolff & van Ijzendoorn, 1997; Goldsmith & Alansky, 1987) to emphasize the 
need to convincingly response to the different needs of the child over time 
(Pickering & Sanders, 2016). This kind of flexible parenting is linked to the op-
timal cognitive, behavioral and social outcomes (Belsky et al., 2006; Feldman, 
2007, cited in Rilling & Mascaro, 2016). The gradual shift of parenting ethics to 
positive facets of child development and well-being is described next. 

3. The Parenting Shift towards Positivity 

All elements of positive physical, social, emotional, and cognitive develop-
ment of a child are transformable—and presumably, improvable (Bornstein & 
Bornstein, 2007; Park & Peterson, 2006). Nevertheless, rather than focusing on 
teaching children what is right and wrong, positive parenting focuses on devel-
oping children’s innate ability to intrinsically tell what is right and what is wrong 
(Gray, 2007), or to be intrinsically motivated (Bandura, 1997; Ryan & Deci, 2000; 
Brown & Ryan, 2004; Boniwell, 2012). However, there has not been found an 
agreed definition of positive parenting (Holden, 1985; Patterson, 1992; Pettit et 
al., 1993), or any method for measuring it (Conger et al., 1993; Patterson, 1992; 
Pettit et al., 1993) as noted by Russell and Russell (1996). 

Specifically, positive parenting, including warmth, affection, monitoring, pos-
itive engagement (Caspi et al., 2004; Smith, Landry, & Swank, 2000), and in-
volvement was reported to be a protective factor against poor developmental 
outcomes (Bishop & Rothbaum, 1992; Feldman, Rosenthal, Mont-Reynaud, 
Leung, & Lau, 1991; Gardner, 1987, 1992; Holden, 1983, 1985; Pettit & Bates, 
1989; Pettit, Bates, & Dodge, 1993, as quoted by Russell & Russell, 1996). Draw-
ing on the work of Adler (1958) and Dreikurs and Soltz (1964), numerous con-
ceptual frameworks were proposed for child-raising, carrying the adjective “pos-
itive”. This parenting ethics shift towards positivity was followed by the United 
Nations Children’s Rights Declaration (UNF, 2006). 

The most influencing theoretical frameworks include the following: a) Posi-
tive Discipline (Nelsen, 1979, 2006; Durrant, 2011); b) Positive parenting (Sand-
ers, 2003); c) The Positive Psychology Movement (Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 
2000); d) Positive Psychology Parenting (Seligman, 2002). 

Positive Discipline Overview. Positive Discipline (Nelsen, 1979, 2006; Dur-
rant, 2011) is a parental and classroom management method that excludes phys-
ical punishment and uses positive reinforcement and other techniques that en-
courage positive behaviors discouraging negative ones. As Adler proposed, Posi-
tive discipline is based on a “kind and firm” (or democratic) approach to teach-
ing and parenting (Adler, 1958; Dreikurs & Soltz, 1964; Nelsen, 1979, 2006). Un-
like behaviorism, it encourages internal locus of control (Nelsen, Lott, & Glenn, 
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2000). Positive discipline, as framed by Nelsen, elaborates the work of Baumrind 
(1967) on parenting styles. It emphasizes on long-term benefits of the “kind and 
firm” parenting style in contrast to styles with only short-term effectiveness—if 
any—including controlling, permissive and neglectful parenting styles (Lott & 
Nelsen, 2000). The kind and firm discipline style has also been proposed as a 
classroom management method (Nelsen, Lott, & Glenn, 2000). A different 
model of positive discipline equates discipline to teaching a set of principles 
with the purpose of learning children how to succeed and acquire knowledge, 
by eliminating all violent parent-child interactions (Durrant, 2011). Positive 
discipline excludes violence and it is solution-oriented (Durrant, 2011). In this 
case, the target population is children with “particular challenges that are not 
typical for their age” (Durrant, 2011). The term “positive” by this approach 
describes a non-authoritarian control practice (Nelsen, 1979, 2006) or the 
avoidance of parent violence (Durrant, 2011) to correct an unwanted child 
behavior. 

Positive Parenting Overview. In a similar vein, Positive Parenting, generally 
implemented by the Triple-P Positive Parenting program (Sanders, 1999, 2008), 
while centered around positive discipline, it extends positive practices beyond 
parental control to include every aspect of parental behavior, as well as satisfac-
tion from the parental role and realistic expectations for the child. The emphasis 
of this positive parenting model—like Durrant’s (2011) approach—is put on 
stopping child maltreatment and abuse, enhancing at the same time parental 
warmth and satisfaction from a parent-child relationship (Sanders, 2012). The 
Triple P-Positive Parenting Program adopts a public health framework focusing 
on warm, consistent parenting and contingent discipline in a low-conflict family 
setting (Pickering & Sanders, 2016). Triple P, adopting the principle of propor-
tionate universalism targets to both early intervention and prevention. The pro-
gram covers all developmental stages from infancy to adolescence and the inter-
ventions can vary from narrow for at-risk children/parents to broad for large- 
scale interventions (Pickering & Sanders, 2016). 

Generally, parenting programs are oriented towards prevention and treatment 
of social, emotional and behavioral problems including children with develop-
mental disabilities (Tellegen & Sanders, 2014; Whittingham, Sanders, McKinlay, 
& Boyd, 2014), feeding problems (Adamson, Morawska, & Sanders, 2013), an-
xiety disorders (Rapee, Kennedy, Ingram, Edwards, & Sweeney, 2010), recurrent 
pain syndromes (Sanders, Cleghorn, Shepherd, & Patrick, 1996), or childhood 
obesity (West, Sanders, Cleghorn, & Davies, 2010) as reported by Pickering and 
Sanders (2005). 

On the other hand, parenting programs are limited to few recommendations 
due to “inconclusive results” probably attributed to developmental differences, 
in an attempt to include all possible families (Durlak, 2003, cited in Weissberg, 
Kumpfer, & Seligman, 2003), i.e. the public health approach (Pickering & Sand-
ers, 2005; Sanders, 2008). 

The Positive Psychology Movement Overview. Although Positive Psychol-

https://doi.org/10.4236/psych.2018.97104


T. A. Kyriazos, A. Stalikas 
 

 

DOI: 10.4236/psych.2018.97104 1766 Psychology 
 

ogy is not exclusively oriented to parenting, it brought about a change in the 
outlook of “psychology as usual” (i.e. classic psychology, Seligman & Pawelski, 
2003; Hefferon & Boniwell, 2011; Seligman, Railton, Baumeister, & Sripada, 
2016) that can also affect parenting practices (Seligman, 2002). 

It has been twenty years since Martin Seligman, as the new APA president 
addressed to the 107th Annual Convention of the American Psychological Asso-
ciation in Boston, on August 21, 1999 (Linley et al., 2009), announcing the Posi-
tive Psychology movement, an umbrella term for the empirical study of “what 
makes life worth living” (Peterson, 2013; Seligman, 2011). Thus, the purpose of 
Positive Psychology has been to study all factors contributing to human flou-
rishing on both a personal and a community level (Gable & Haidt, 2005; Linley 
& Joseph, 2015). 

In fact, Martin Seligman used his 2000 term presidency of the American Psy-
chological Association (Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 2000) to communicate the 
disproportionate focus of “psychology as usual” on pathology (Wood & John-
son, 2016; Schueller & Parks, 2014) and to propose a new orientation to human 
functioning, based on solid, empirical evidence (Seligman, 2011). Seligman di-
verted this, now bourgeoning discipline, to the study of well-being (Ryff & 
Keyes, 1995; Keyes, 2002; Vittersø et al., 2010), happiness (Diener, 2000), flou-
rishing (Seligman, 2011; Diener et al., 2009, 2010), and the life well-lived (cited 
in Burns, 2010). During these early stages, there was a need for positive psy-
chology to highlight the inferential error of equating well-being to the absence of 
mental illness (Seligman, 2002, 2006; Fredrickson, 2013a). To this end, the 
Jahoda (1958) model of mental health/illness was used. This is a continuum with 
mental illness on one end rated at −8 and mental health on the opposite end 
rated at +8. Zero indicates the absence of mental illness (Seaton, 2009). Accord-
ing to (Seligman, 1998; Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 2000) “psychology as 
usual” mostly focused on helping individuals move from −5 to −2 while positive 
psychology focuses on helping individuals move from +2 to as high as possible 
(Hefferon & Boniwell, 2012), seeking well-being. 

Well-being is defined as the positive evaluation of life by the individual (Se-
ligman, 2002; Diener & Seligman, 2004). Ryan and Deci (2001) relate well-being 
to optimal experience (like flow; Csikszentmihalyi, 1975/2000) and generally to 
optimal psychological functioning (Keyes, 2002; Huppert & So, 2013; Kahne-
man, Diener, & Schwarz, 1999). Only when basic needs are satisfied well-being 
can be achieved (Maslow, 1968, 1975; Boniwell, 2012). The World Health Or-
ganization also defined health in relation to well-being as follows: “a state of 
complete physical, mental and social well-being and not merely the absence of 
disease or infirmity” (WHO, 1978). 

In a similar vein, flourishing is a mental health state that has psychological 
vigor originating from feeling well and doing well on a personal and community 
level, free from psychopathology and mental distress (Fredrickson & Losada, 
2005; Seligman, 2011). Of course, mental problems cannot be eliminated, never-
theless, they loom larger by the exclusive focus of psychology on the human 
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weaknesses (Snyder et al., 2002). Crucially, the purpose of positive psychology is 
not to advise people to be happy or optimistic but to provide solid evidence of 
the positive impact of well-being on human functioning (Seligman, 2007, 2011). 

Thus, positive psychology is the study of positive emotions (as defined within 
the Broaden and Build framework; Fredrickson, 1998, 2001) and character 
strengths (Snyder & Lopez, 2007). According to Seligman (2002) Positive Psy-
chology has three pillars: the study of positive emotions is the first through the 
framework of Broaden and Build theory (Fredrickson, 1998, 2001), the study of 
character strengths and virtues (Seligman & Peterson, 2004; Park, 2009) is the 
second and the study of positive institutions comes third (Seligman, 2002). 
Strong families are considered to be an institution nurturing positive emotions 
and character strengths through parenthood. Thus, strong flourishing families 
are the setting of parenting with the principles of positive psychology (Seligman, 
2002). 

Positive Psychology Parenting Overview. In “Authentic Happiness” (2002), 
shortly after the launch of the Positive Psychology movement, Seligman de-
scribed Positive Psychology parenting. Positive Psychology parenting is based on 
the fundamental principles of Positive Psychology, i.e. positive emotions and 
character strengths and values (Seligman, 2002). 

The purpose of Positive Psychology parenting (Seligman, 2002) is to provide 
positive emotions and also to find and elaborate child’s character strengths, thus 
to promote well-being. In the long, the goal of Positive Psychology parenting is 
to help the child structure his life (i.e. education, career, hobbies) around his 
most frequently used character strengths. During this process, the whole family’s 
well-being and signature strengths are also enhanced. These two elements, posi-
tive emotions and character strengths are the backbone of both Positive Psy-
chology and Positive Psychology parenting (Seligman, 2002). 

Crucially, unlike positive discipline, Triple-P positive parenting and other 
similar approaches, the target group of positive psychology parenting is normal-
ly adjusted children (Seligman, 2002), in agreement with positive psychology. 
Note also that in this context, the adjective positive denotes positive emotions 
within the Broaden and Build theoretical framework (Fredrickson, 2001) and 
not non-punitive parenting practices. 

To put it in a nutshell, children’s well-being has been conceptualized to be 
merely the absence of psychological maladjustment, or/and the presence of posi-
tive outcomes regarding academic, interpersonal, athletic, and artistic success 
(Scales, Benson, Leffert, & Blyth, 2000). The primary focus of academic work has 
been on the cure of psychological maladjustment, especially childhood disorders, 
deficits and disabilities or the development of prevention-oriented interventions 
(Bornstein & Bornstein, 2007). Actually, the focus on these behaviors have sti-
mulated the formulation of numerous programs, even public health policies to 
prevent child maladjustment (Catalano, Berglund, Ryan, Lonczak, & Hawkins, 
1999). 

When Seligman founded Positive Psychology (Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 
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2000), he laid the foundations of child-raising within the Positive Psychology 
perspective. Until then, parenting was commented by the founder of Positive 
Psychology (2002) as follows: There is a need for a better psychology for all 
normally adjusted children that equally studies positive emotions as distressing 
ones, at work, marriage, and parenting and will help children use their strengths 
every day in all life domains (Seligman, 2002: p. 11). 

In the positive psychology parenting model proposed here three essential dif-
ferentiations pinpoint the dissimilar approach of positive psychology parenting 
from the positive discipline and the positive parenting as follows: a) the target 
group; b) the general orientation, and finally c) the content that the adjective 
“positive” receives. The dissimilarities can be attributed to the different orienta-
tion of positive psychology in comparison to “psychology as usual” (Boniwell, 
2012; Hefferon & Boniwell, 2011; Seligman, 2002; Seligman & Pawelski, 2003). 
Of course this is not to say that other parenting models are less positive, or even 
less effective, but to highlight they are orientated primarily in prevention and 
treatment in line with the purpose of “psychology as usual”, while the proposed 
positive psychology parenting model is orientated to the flourishing of all nor-
mally adjusted children through broadening and building positive emotions and 
cultivating character strengths in line with the purpose of positive psychology 
(see Table 1 for an outline). 

Next, the construct of positive psychology parenting is described in more de-
tail. 

The Principles of Positive Psychology Parenting 

According to Seligman (2002), two core elements that enable children to flourish 
are 1) positive emotions as defined by Broaden and Build Theory (Fredrickson, 
2001), and 2) the character strengths (Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 2000). Cha-
racter strengths are a sub-category of personality attributes having a moral value, 
e.g. politeness as opposed to introversion which has no moral dimension (Pe-
terson & Park, 2009). Fredrickson defines character strengths as habits (Fre-
drickson, 2009). 

Regarding positive emotions, Seligman (2002) lists as important the emotions 
of joy, hope, interest, curiosity, and several others. Moreover, after two decades 
of extensive research the top-ten of positive feelings are (in order of impor-
tance): joy, gratitude, serenity, interest, hope, pride, fun, inspiration, awe and 
love (Fredrickson, 2009; Hefferon & Boniwell, 2012). 

Concerning character strengths, their importance is evidenced by the expecta-
tion of parents from their children. Most of them wish their offspring to have a 
character strength such as kindness, politeness, etc. (Seligman, 2002; Seligman, 
Park, & Peterson, 2006). Generally, research into parents-to-be suggests their 
expectations from their children are definitely in the Positive Psychology re-
search scope: health and happiness, job satisfaction, character strengths and val-
ues, contribution to the common good (Cameron, Dutton, Quinn, & Wrzes-
niewski, 2003) and generally concern all life domains (Moore & Lippman, 2005). 
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Table 1. Orientation comparison of positive discipline, positive parenting and positive psychology parenting. 

 Positive Discipline Positive Parenting Positive Psychology Parenting 

Goal Prevention & Treatment Prevention & Treatment Flourishing 

Jahoda (1958) model goal 
Move from −2 to zero  

(no mental disease) 
Move from −2 to zero  

(no mental disease) 
Move from 0 to as high as possible 

Target Group Cases with special challenges Special & General population General population 

Family level impact 
No unpleasant parent-child  

interactions 
Low-conflict family environment 

Good/meaningful life for the whole 
family 

“Positive” means 
Non-violent, non-punitive parenting 

or Kind & Firm parenting 
Non-violent, non-maltreating  

parenting 

Positive emotions and their  
Broadening and building effect  
proposed by Fredrickson (2001) 

 (Durrant, 2011; Nelsen, 2006) (Sanders, 2012) (Seligman, 2002) 

 
Positive Psychology seeks to answer the following questions as far as parent-

ing is concerned according to Seligman’s (2002) own words: 
“Can there be a psychological science that is about the best things in life? Can 

there be a classification of the strengths and virtues that make life worth living? 
Can parents and teachers use this science to raise strong, resilient children ready 
to take their place in a world in which more opportunities for fulfillment are 
available?” (Seligman, 2002: p. 11). 

Regarding the target group of Positive Psychology Parenting, the disease/health 
model (Jahoda, 1958) was used to establish the target group, and the purpose of 
Positive Psychology parenting. Seligman describes it as follows: 

“Raising children, I knew now, was far more than just fixing what was wrong 
with them. It was about identifying and amplifying their strengths and virtues 
and helping them find the niche where they can live these positive traits to the 
fullest” (Seligman, 2002: p. 11). 

Seligman (2002) put parenting in the realm of the good life, defining it as fol-
lows. Child raising is an opportunity to: a) Apply the principles of Positive Psy-
chology to increase well-being and flourishing of the parent and the child alike; 
b) Increase the level of positive emotions to the child; c) Discover strengths and 
signature strengths and then nurture these signature strengths; d) Forge child’s 
life around his/her signature strengths as a means of balancing his/her weak-
nesses and as a source of well-being. 

The parenthood Seligman (2002) proposed is based on the pillars of Positive 
Psychology as presented in Table 2. 

Positive Emotions: The 1st Pillar of Positive Psychology Parenting 
In line with the Broaden and Build Theory of Positive Emotions (Fredrick-

son, 1998, 2001), Seligman (2002) vividly describes that evolution has favored 
both types of emotions, positive and negative. Negatives serve as a survival 
advantage by narrowing awareness, to permit to the threatened individual to 
focus on survival (Fredrickson, 2003). Negative emotions such as fear, disgust, 
and anger are a defense against external dangers, essentially a win-lose situation, 
where the net result is zero (zero-sum games; Seligman, 2002). On the other 
hand, positive emotions broaden our awareness (Fredrickson & Branigan, 2005;  
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Table 2. The pillars of positive psychology parenting as defined by Seligman (2002). 

Pillar 1 
Positive Emotions. Positive emotions of the child are considered to be of key impor-
tance. 

Pillar 2 
Character Strengths. Knowing and using character strengths and values in all realms of 
life (play, education, activities) 

 
Rowe, Hirsh, & Anderson, 2007; Wadlinger & Isaacowitz, 2006), can undo neg-
ative emotions (Fredrickson & Levenson, 1998; Fredrickson et al., 2000), buffer 
against adversity (Fredrickson, Cohn, Coffey, Pek, & Finkel, 2008), and finally 
fuel more positive emotions (upward spiral; Fredrickson, 2003; Garland, Fre-
drickson, Kring, Johnson, Meyer, & Penn, 2010). Natural selection (Darwin, 
1871) has favored negative emotions because they offered our ancestors better 
chances of survival, Seligman (2002) comments. 

Thus, Broaden-and-Build theory of positive emotions describes why we inhe-
rited both positive and negative emotions (Fredrickson, 1998, 2001, 2013), ba-
lancing the importance of positive emotions to the negative ones (Seligman, 
2002). For Seligman (2002), this directly opposes to the psychoanalytic theory 
(Freud, 1962; see also Mussen, Rutherford, Harris, & Keasey, 1970), the prevail-
ing theory in psychology literature at that time, postulating that negative emo-
tions are the foundations of negative motivation and that positive motivation is 
simply fueled by the negative one. Besides, he concludes that this “rotten-to-the- 
core” dogma is empirically unfounded (Seligman, 2002). Moreover, this dual 
view of emotions, which gives both negative and positive emotions the same 
evolutionary value, is also the basic assumption for human motives from the 
perspective of positive psychology (Seligman, 2002). 

After two decades of research, empirical evidence (as reviewed by Fredrick-
son, Cohn, Coffey, Pek, & Finkel, 2008) suggests that positive emotions are re-
lated to many positive outcomes like better socialization and social support 
(Waugh & Fredrickson, 2006), openness to new acquaintances (Dunn & 
Schweitzer, 2005), constructive feedback (Raghunathan & Trope, 2002), marital 
satisfaction and happy marriage (Harker & Keltner, 2001), higher income (Di-
ener, Nickerson, Lucus, & Sandvik, 2002), better health (Doyle, Gentile, & Co-
hen, 2006), and even longevity (Danner, Snowdon, & Friesen, 2001; Ostir, Mar-
kides, Black, & Goodwin, 2000). 

Fredrickson’s (2001) Broaden and Build theory has consequences for a child 
that are “broadening, building, and abiding” as Seligman (2002) describes. Posi-
tive emotions for Seligman (2002) promote growth and pinpoint a win-win situ-
ation for the child and the parents. This may be because in general they nurture 
trust in personal relations (Hejmadi, Waugh, Otake, & Fredrickson, 2008) and 
openness to new experiences (Dunn & Schweitzer, 2005), and they undo nega-
tive emotions (Fredrickson, 2003; Fredrickson & Levenson, 1998; Fredrickson et 
al., 2000). They also add positive resources that in times of hardship can act as a 
buffer, or a protective mechanism of resilience (Fredrickson, 2013b). 

Moreover, when children have a positive emotion, they think more creatively 
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and resourcefully, and they are more willing to start exploring their environment 
(Seligman, 2002). Exploration builds knowledge and mastery and through this 
process of skill acquisition, the strengths of character gradually emerge. For this 
reason, positive emotions are plentiful to small children, Seligman (2002) ex-
plains. Seligman also comments that positive emotions fuel creativity and help in 
building skills and mastery. Those, in turn, generate more positive emotions and 
more creativity and mastery (Seligman, 2002). This ongoing cycle of positivity 
(upward spiral; Fredrickson, 1998, 2001) is quite important for the secure at-
tachment of the child (Seligman, 2002). 

Crucially, up-to-date empirical evidence suggests that positive emotions’ ef-
fects have an Inverted-U curve. This means that the more positive emotions, the 
better for the individual but only up to a point (Diener, Colvin, Pavot, & Allman, 
1991). Similar findings, Fredrickson (2013b) explains, were also reported for 
creativity (George & Zhou, 2007), income and political participation (Oishi, Di-
ener, & Lucas, 2007). This nonlinearity is directly differentiated from the linear 
models of psychological phenomena (Frederickson & Losada, 2005; Fredrickson, 
2013b). Nevertheless, this may not necessarily be true for parenthood, because 
Seligman (2002) notes that positive emotions can be abundant to children and 
are offered unconditionally. More specifically, Seligman (2002) postulates the 
three fundamental principles of Positive Psychology Parenting (see Table 3). 

According to the first principle of positive psychology parenting, positive 
emotions help children to build resources at an emotional, cognitive, social and 
even physical level (Seligman, 2002), and at the same time to gather positive re-
sources to draw from when facing adversity (Seligman, 2002; Fredrickson, 1998, 
2001, 2009, 2013b). On the contrary, every time children experience negative 
emotions, they have the innate tendency to protect themselves, thus they search 
for a familiar, safe place, and when unavailable they freeze in their place (Selig-
man, 2002), i.e. reacting impulsively. 

Then, Seligman (2002) adds, when they will feel safe again they will leave their 
sanctuary, starting to explore again the world by playing. Exploration causes 
even more positive emotions, or in other words an upward spiral of positive 
emotions (Fredrickson, 1998, 2001, 2003), as stated in the second principle of 
positive psychology parenting, in the child (Seligman, 2002) as well as in the 
adult (Fredrickson, 1998, 2001, 2009, 2013b). This process could be comparable 
to circular causality (von Bertalanffy, 1976), described by the systemic view of 

 
Table 3. The three core principles of Positive Psychology Parenting as described by Se-
ligman (2002). 

Principle 1 
Positive emotions broaden and build (Fredrickson, 1998, 2001) cognitive, social, 
emotional and physical resources and capitalize them for children to rely on them 
later in life. 

Principle 2 
Increasing positive emotions in children can initiate an upward spiral of positive 
emotions according to the Broaden and Build theory of Positive Emotions  
(Fredrickson, 1998, 2001). 

Principle 3 
The positive traits children show are equally important to the negative ones  
(Seligman, 2002).  
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child development (Bronfenbrenner, 1977; Super & Harkness, 1997; Bornstein, 
2002; Lerner, Rothbaum, Boulos, & Castellino, 2002). 

Furthermore, positive emotions are directly related to secure attachment 
(Bowlby, 1969; Ainsworth et al., 1978). Positive emotions expressed by mothers 
to children facilitate secure attachment especially during infancy or later (Juffer, 
Bakermans-Kranenburg & van Ijzendoorn, 2008). It is empirically supported 
that the surely attached children perform better than non-securely attached 
children in problem-solving, creativity and exploration, independence, enthu-
siasm, and resilience (van Ijzendoorn, Bakermans-Kranenburg, & Sagi-Schwartz, 
2006; Juffer, Bakermans-Kranenburg & van Ijzendoorn, 2008). The second pillar 
of positive psychology parenting (Seligman, 2002) is the character strengths of 
children and the whole family in general, with the purpose to build a niche (Su-
per & Harkness, 1997, 1986) where any family member can flourish (Seligman, 
2011) pursuing the good life (Seligman, 2002). 

A parenting style expressing positive emotions like warmth, involvement, and 
affection is the authoritative parenting style (Baumrind, 1967, 1971). This has 
been essentially reported to have positive parenting outcomes with regard to 
children’s psychological adjustment and perceived well-being (Rasmussen, 2009). 
Besides, a warmer parent-child relationship can reinforce secure attachment (c.f. 
Seligman, 2002), positive intellectual, social and emotional development, higher 
school performance and academic perspective, and better socialization. Finally, 
according to the same source (Rasmussen, 2009), the children of warm and ex-
pressive parents have a higher self-esteem as well as greater optimism, and high-
er subjective well-being (see Diener, 1984), a finding reported especially among 
adolescent samples (Baumrind, 1991; Milevsky et al., 2007; Jach et al., 2018; 
Schwartz et al., 2012). 

Character Strengths Are the 2nd Pillar of Positive Psychology Parenting 
The empirical literature has been a central focus of Positive psychology and 

has been really rich (Seligman, 2009). Positive characteristics have been reported 
to predict well-being (Park, Peterson, & Seligman, 2004) as well as performance 
(Park & Peterson, 2006). Furthermore, positive traits are changeable (Seligman, 
Steen, Park, & Peterson, 2005) and teachable (Shoshani & Slone; 2013; Proctor et 
al., 2010; Eades, 2008; Park & Peterson, 2009; McGovern & Miller, 2008), as 
commented in Ng, Cao, Marsh, Tay and Seligman (2017). 

Thus, a classification model of positive psychological traits, or to put it diffe-
rently, character strengths, can diagnose and enhance flourishing (Peterson, 
2006). Seligman (2002) recommends VIA Classification version for children 
(VIA, Mayerson Foundation, 2000; VIA-Youth Classification, (Seligman & Pe-
terson, 2004) to identify their signature strengths (Peterson & Seligman, 2004). 
The instrument consists of six categories of 24 pan-cultural character strengths 
and values (Peterson & Seligman, 2004). According to VIA Classification of 
Character Strengths and Values (Peterson & Seligman, 2004), the most fre-
quently displayed character strengths are the signature strengths of the child 
(Peterson & Seligman, 2004; Seligman, Steen, Park & Peterson, 2006; Peterson & 
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Park, 2009). Generally, parents have a major influence on the character of their 
offspring (Gardner et al., 2001, 1988, cited in Park, 2004). 

In the light of the above findings, a new research field was developed, studying 
the use of character strengths in relation to many well-being variables in adults 
(Seligman et al., 2005), students (Allan & Duffy, 2014), and children in relation 
to reprieved life satisfaction (Proctor et al., 2010; Suldo et al., 2014; Waters, 
2015), school adaptability (Shoshani & Slone, 2013), and finally hope and resi-
lience (Waters, 2015). 

Indeed, character strengths and values are the links between Positive Institu-
tions (in this case parenthood and family) and positive emotions (Park & Peter-
son, 2009). Nevertheless, positive psychology only recently began to study pa-
renthood in relation to the child’s strengths and values as part of the parenting 
process (Rasmussen, 2009; Huta, 2012; Waters, 2015; Jach et al., 2018), despite 
its interest in positive education (Fox & Fades, 2008), and positive youth devel-
opment (Larson, 2000). Furthermore, developmental psychology was equally 
unmotivated both for studying positive youth development (Larson, 2000) and 
character strengths’ development (Park, 2004). 

Seligman (2002) comments that discovering and building character strengths 
and values is like the acquisition of the language (Seligman, 2002). During this 
process, Seligman (2002) stresses that on the appearance of character strengths 
or values, parents must identify, name and praise it, to motivate the child to re-
peat, acquire and eventually enhance it. Empirical research has subsequently 
confirmed Seligman’s premise, since the well-being of children and youngsters 
was greater when their parents identified and encouraged their character 
strengths (Waters, 2015). 

The increase of positive emotions in children by their parents promotes secure 
attachment and enhances playfulness, creativity, resourcefulness, and explora-
tion as Fredrickson (1998, 2001, 2013b) initially proposed, and as Seligman fur-
ther elaborated about children (Seligman, 2002; see also Figure 1). This creative 
state boosts experimentation, therefore, children can develop many different 
skills (Seligman, 2002). In turn, increasing skills causes even more positive emo-
tions (an upward spiral of positive emotions, Fredrickson, 1998, 2001, 2013b). 
Crucially, throughout this explorative and creative phase, character strengths 
and values are being discovered and built (Seligman, 2002). Seligman (2002) 
further notes that some character strengths will appear and then disappear while 
others will recurrently keep reappearing again and again. 

Furthermore, Seligman (2002) suggested to adapt the child’s education to 
his/her character strengths and values. In line with this idea, subsequently, a rich 
empirical research followed focusing on the enactment of character strengths 
and values in parenting. Besides, character strengths have been successfully in-
tegrated within some educational curricula (Eades, 2008; Park & Peterson, 2009) 
or educational institutes (Geelong Grammer School in Australia) and also in an 
academic learning environment (McGovern & Miller, 2008). 
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Figure 1. How positive emotions are related to Character Strengths (Seligman, 2002). 

 
A large part of the empirical research on character strengths was focused on 

elaborating their impact on the well-being of children and adolescents, under 
different conditions: being aware of their character strengths and using them, 
and not being aware of them and not using them or being aware of them and not 
using them (Govindji & Linley, 2007; Proctor et al., 2010; Seligman et al., 2005). 
The knowledge and use of character strengths contribute more to well-being and 
life satisfaction (Waters, 2015; Govindji & Linley, 2007). Interventions in pupils 
showed similar results (Quinlan et al., 2012). Additionally, positive role model-
ing (Bandura, 1997; Huta, 2012) is also considered to be of great importance for 
the development of character strengths (Park & Peterson, 2009; Waters, 2015; 
Huta, 2012) and for agency and pathways mindset (Snyder, 2000). Note that 
parents can also integrate their own character strengths in their parenting role to 
improve parenting practices (Rasmussen, 2009). 

Generally, character strengths have been reported to correlate with children’s 
satisfaction with life and well-being (Waters, 2015). Especially for teenagers, 
character strengths are shown to be strongly associated with life satisfaction, 
love, gratitude, hope, and enjoyment (Niemiec, 2013). On the other hand, in-
fants and children from 3 to 9 years perceiving themselves as happy have also 
shown the character strengths of love, hope, and zest, as reported by their par-
ents (Park & Peterson, 2009; Niemiec, 2013). Moreover, based on a study of 
identical and fraternal twins, the character strengths have been found to be 
moderately hereditary (Steger, Hicks, Kashdan, Krueger, & Bouchard, 2007). 
Additionally, recent evidence showed that positive psychology interventions 
targeting character strengths (e.g. Proyer et al., 2015) and children of special 
populations (Shogren et al., 2015) were effective. Similar studies were carried out 
on psychologically distressed adults (see Sin & Lyubomirsky, 2009). 

Regarding the parenting process per se, the character strength of parental 
self-regulation was strongly related to child satisfaction but not to the parental 
satisfaction (Park & Peterson, 2006; Niemiec, 2013). Finally, emphasizing and 
boosting character strengths by parents found to have a positive effect on the 
well-being of the children (Park, 2009; Waters, 2015) and generally creating a 
mutually beneficial situation (win-win) for the parent-child relationship, as al-
ready postulated in Authentic Happiness by Seligman (2002). 

Summing up, Positive Psychology Parenting, as postulated by Seligman (2002) 
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has been structured around the expression of unconditional, abundant positive 
emotions to the child, especially during infancy, and the development of the 
child’s character strengths and values, through the mastery acquired by creativi-
ty and exploration developing by positive emotions. 

4. The Proposed Model for the Positive Psychology Parenting 

Seligman (2002) implicitly adopts the systemic view on parenting and family be-
cause he integrates family and child-raising in the center of a wider pattern of in-
teractions proposing that the external environment (school, job, hobbies, marital 
and social relations) also influence and get influenced by positive emotions of all 
members. Only when every member of this open system has positive emotions, 
has acquired his/her strengths and has built education, carrier, and other activities 
around him/her can have a “good life”. Positive family therapy also adopts the 
same view (Conoley & Conoley, 2009; Conoley, Conoley, & Pontrelli, 2014). 

The definition of Positive Psychology Parenting based on this model (Selig-
man, 2002) is the following: Parenting is an integral part of good life, a life do-
main in which the parent can: a) Apply the principles of Positive Psychology to 
achieve personal life satisfaction and flourishing for himself/herself and his/her 
children; b) Increase the level of positive emotions of the child; c) Discover the 
character strengths of the child; d) Build every possible domain of child’s life 
around his/her character strengths in order to strengthen them, as a means of 
balancing weaknesses and as a source of well-being. 

The parenting of positive psychology was based on the pillars of Positive Psy-
chology as follows: 1) Positive Emotions. Expressing positive emotions so as to 
have securely attached children ready and willing to explore their environment 
thus developing skills. 2) Character Strengths. Encouraging, naming and en-
hancing every character strength and value that appears along the way.  

The actual model of positive psychology parenting was defined as follows by 
Seligman (2002) and it is essentially related to the process of building positive 
emotions first and then character strengths and virtues (see also Figure 2): 
 Up to the age of six, the emphasis of positive psychology parenting is primar-

ily put on the increase of the child’s positive emotions, showing abundant 
and unconditional positive emotions. 

 Then positive emotions through their broadening effect (Fredrickson, 1998, 
2001) boost exploration, creativity, and resourcefulness. 

 Exploration and creativity build skills, abilities and more positive emotions 
(upward spiral; Fredrickson, 1998, 2001). 

 Throughout this process of acquiring mastery through play, character 
strengths and values gradually appear. On the appearance of each character 
strength or value, the parent should praise, name and encourage the child 
(positive reinforcement). This process is more effective if the parent acts as a 
role model (Bandura, 1997) 

 By positive reinforcement, child identifies potential sources of positive emo-
tions such as love, interest, or praise. Consequently, he/she will repeat the  
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Figure 2. The proposed model of positive psychology parenting as defined by Seligman 
(2002). 

 
strength in an attempt to receive again the same positive emotions from sig-
nificant others. By the age of six, in most cases, character strengths start to 
appear more consistently. 

 During this process, some character strength attempts are successful and 
others are not.  

 Eventually, the child stops showing strengths that in the past triggered a fail-
ure and starts repeating others linked to more successful attempts. 

 Finally, some strengths and values are more intense and frequent. These are 
probably the signature strengths of the child.  

 If parents tailor his/her education, skills, activities and later career on the 
signature strengths and values, the child will have higher probabilities of 
achieving a “good life”. 

 Positive emotions expressed by parents at any point fuel the appearance of 
character strengths and boost parents’ own flourishing. 

However, for the above parenting model to be able to take place and poten-
tially succeed certain basic parenting conditions must be met as described by 
Bradley and Caldwell (1995; Bradley, 2002). They proposed a set of parenting 
tasks required as a prerequisite for healthy child development: 1) sustenance 
(survival and biological integrity), 2) stimulation (cognitive and social-emotional 
stimulation), 3) support, 4) structure, and 5) surveillance. The first three tasks 
are based on what was defined as basic needs in Maslow’s Hierarchy of needs 
(1975, and Ford & Lerner, 1992 as commented by Bradley, 2002). The last two 
prerequisites are supporting the first three to contingently meet every child’s 
needs (Bradley, 2002). Besides, for well-being to be accomplished basic needs 
must be met (Ryan & Deci, 2000; Boniwell, 2012). 

5. Conclusion 

Empirical research has been the main tool of the Positive Psychology Movement 
(Seligman, 2009). In spite of the rich empirical literature (Boniwell, 2012), Posi-
tive Psychology parenting research is in its infancy. However, those Positive 
Psychology parenting principles have been postulated (Seligman, 2002), almost 
ever since Positive Psychology movement started (Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 
2000). Perhaps this gap could be attributed to a relatively blurred image due to 
the use of the term “positive” concurrently by positive discipline (Nelsen, 1979; 
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Durrant, 2011), positive parenting (Sanders, 2003, Triple P-Positive Parenting 
Program) and Positive Psychology (Seligman & Csikszentmihalyi, 2000). Despite 
this parallel use of the term “positive”, in the case of the first two, the term “pos-
itive” basically refers to the non-punitive, or firm and kind parenting style. Ad-
ditionally, they are mainly (but not exclusively) intended for special populations 
(Durrant, 2011; Pickering & Sanders, 2016) seeking prevention and treatment. In 
the case of Positive Psychology, the term “positive” refers to the broadening and 
building effect of positive emotions (Fredrickson, 1998, 2001; Seligman, 2002), 
the target population is all normally adjusted children, and the purpose is not 
help the child reach zero (i.e. the prevention and treatment goal of “psychology 
as usual”) but to move from plus 2 to as high as possible pursuing flourishing, in 
line with the purpose of positive psychology. To put it in a nutshell, positive dis-
cipline and positive parenting differ from positive psychology parenting in ways 
equivalent to the differences of “psychology as usual” from positive psychology. 
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